PORTABLE TOILET RENTAL
AND
SERVICE(S) AND SEPTIC TANK PUMPING
2/27/25

G & H Enterprises, LL.C dba Rentals to Go, 6108 County Road 32, Norwich, NY 13815 (877) 929-1919 / (607) 334-5646
Larry’s Latrines, 894 State Route 21, Hornell, NY 14843, (607) 324-5015

PORTABLE TOILET RENTAL SERVICE(S)

G & H Enterprises, LLC LARRY’S LATRINES

In Toto Price Bid per Extended In Toto Price Bid per Extended

Estimated Unit Price Bid Unit Price Bid

Quantity: Rental/service per:
40 Weeks $ 8.00 / per week $320.00 $ 11.00/per week $440.00

Rental of Standard Portable
Toilets:

24 Months $ 85.00 / per month $2,040.00 || $100.00/ per month $2,400.00
10 Extra Cleanouts $10.00 / per cleanout $100.00 $20.00 / per cleanout $200.00

Rental of Handicap Accessible 4 Days $ 15.00 / per day $60.00 $ 15.00 / per day $60.00

Portable Toilets: 6 Weeks $25.00 / per day $150.00 || $22.00 / per week $132.00
48 Months $ 155.00 / per month $7,440.00 | $110.00/ per month $5,280.00

20 Extra Cleanouts $ 15.00 / per cleanout $300.00 $20.00 / per cleanout $400.00

Rental of Hand Washing System(s):
Typical time frame is from April to Months $ 80.00 / per month $320.00 $ 75.00 / month $300.00%
October.

Cleaning/servicing of County owned . . . .
Portable Toilets: 200 Cleaning/Service $20.00 / per cleaning $4,000.00 || $20.00/ per cleaning $4,000.00

SUM TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE BID
(sum total of all line items): $ 14,730.00 $13,212.00*

*As calculated by Steuben County.

AWARDED BY THE PWC ON MARCH 3, 2025 AS SHADED
PW-25-050-B



PORTABLE TOILET RENTAL
AND
SERVICE(S) AND SEPTIC TANK PUMPING
2/27/25

PUMPING OF SEPTIC TANKS* (ON-CALL BASIS)

G & H Enterprises, LL.C LARRY’S LATRINES

In Toto Price Bid Extended Price Bid In Toto Price Bid

Tank Size: Estimated # of Pump Outs per Call per Call

Extended Price Bid

*Must be pumped within 24 300 Gal. NO BID NO BID

hours of notification.
1,000 Gal. NO BID NO BID

1,250 Gal. NO BID NO BID

1,500 Gal. NO BID NO BID

SUM TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE BID
(sum total of all line items):

PW-25-050-B



