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LIQUID BITUMINOUS MATERIAL(S) 
BID DATE:  1/30/2025 

CONTRACT PERIOD:  DATE OF AWARD – 12/31/2025 
 

 
Midland Asphalt Materials Inc., 640 Young Street, Tonawanda, NY 14150 (716) 692-0730 / (716) 692-0613 
Suit-Kote Corporation, 1911 Lorings Crossing Road, Cortland, New York 13045 (607) 753-1100 / (315) 238-7110 
Vestal Asphalt, Inc., 201 Stage Road, Vestal, New York 13850 (607) 785-3393 / (607) 785-3396 

 
 

FOB – Plant Site  

 
 

 

                                                Used for pothole patching machine. 
                                                          MULTIPLE AWARD BASED ON F.O.B. & TRUCKING COST 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

AWARDED BY THE PWC ON 2/3/2025          
 
 
 
             
 
                                                              

 MIDLAND ASPHALT SUIT-KOTE VESTAL ASPHALT 

Grade Material 
Description 

In Toto Price Bid 
per Gallon 

In Toto Price Bid 
per Gallon 

In Toto Price Bid 
per Gallon 

RS-2 702-3301 $ 3.28 / gallon $ 3.150 / gallon $ 3.50 / gallon 

PLANT SITE (Location) Lyons, NY Watkins Glen, NY Vestal, NY 
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LIQUID BITUMINOUS MATERIAL(S) 

BID DATE:  1/30/2025 
CONTRACT PERIOD:  DATE OF AWARD – 12/31/2025 

 
Emulsion with Distributor 

 

 MIDLAND ASPHAL SUIT-KOTE VESTAL ASPHALT 

Grade Material 
Description 

In Toto Price Bid  
per Gallon 

In Toto Price Bid  
per Gallon 

In Toto Price Bid  
per Gallon 

MC-30 702-20 NB NB NB 
RS-2 (1) 702-3101 $ 3.741 / gallon $ 1.796 / gallon $ 3.350 / gallon 
HFRS-2 (1) 702-3102 $ 3.741 / gallon $ 2.750 / gallon $ 3.400 / gallon 
MS-2 702-3201 $ 4.200 / gallon $ 3.250 / gallon $ 3.500 / gallon 
HFMS-2 702-3301 $ 4.200 / gallon $ 2.900 / gallon $ 3.550 / gallon 
HFMS-2h 702-3401 $ 4.200 / gallon $ 3.100 / gallon $ 3.750 / gallon 
HFMS-2s 702-3402    
CRS-2 (1) 702-4101 $ 3.721 / gallon $ 1.816 / gallon $ 3.400 / gallon 
CMS-2 702-4201 $ 4.180 / gallon NB $ 3.500 / gallon 
CMS-2h 702-4301 $ 4.180 / gallon NB $ 3.700 / gallon 
TACK COAT 702-90 $ 11.25 / gallon $ 11.250 / gallon $ 10.90 / gallon 
SS-1 (2) 702-3501 $ 3.895 / gallon $ 1.776/ gallon $ 1.848 / gallon 
SS-1H (2) 702-3601 $ 3.895 / gallon $ 1.976 / gallon $ 1.848 / gallon 
CSS-1 (2) 702-4401 $ 3.875 / gallon  $ 1.786 / gallon $ 1.848 / gallon 
CSS-1H (2) 702-4501 $ 3.875 / gallon $ 1.986 / gallon $ 1.845 / gallon 
CQS-1H 702-4601 NB $ 6.122 / gallon $ 7.000 / gallon 

(1)  Rapid set liquid asphalt (RS-2, HFRS-2 and CRS-2) is used for chip seal surface treatments.  RS-2 in 2023 (estimated/projected):580,000 gallons.  
(2)  SS-1 are used as road grinder injection liquid asphalts.   

 
 

 
 

LIQUID BITUMINOUS MATERIAL(S) 



1/30/2025 

PW-25-029-B (page 3) 

BID DATE:  1/30/2025 
CONTRACT PERIOD:  DATE OF AWARD – 12/31/2025 

 
Emulsion for Cold Mix 

 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 

 
Liquid Bituminous Material; AEPM 

 
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                        

 
Item 

MIDLAND ASPHALT SUIT-KOTE VESTAL ASPHALT 

In Toto Price Bid  
per Gallon 

In Toto Price Bid per 
Gallon 

In Toto Price Bid per 
Gallon 

Emulsion with Distributor $ 2.40 / gallon $ 2.120 / gallon $ 2.075 / gal. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 MIDLAND ASPHALT SUIT-KOTE VESTAL 

Grade Material 
Description 

In Toto Price Bid  
per Gallon 

In Toto Price Bid 
per Gallon 

In Toto Price Bid per 
Gallon 

MS-2 702-3201 $ 4.530 / gallon $ 3.350 / gallon $ 3.600 / gallon 
HFMS-2 702-3301 $ 4.530 / gallon $ 3.050 / gallon $ 3.650 / gallon 
HFMS-2h 702-3401 $ 4.530 / gallon $ 3.250 / gallon $ 3.850 / gallon 
HFMS-2s    702-3402 $ 5.130 / gallon  $ 3.600 / gallon $ 3.850 / gallon 
CMS-2 702-4201 $ 4.510 / gallon NB $ 3.600 / gallon 
CMS-2h 702-4301 $ 4.510 / gallon NB $ 3.800 / gallon 
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LIQUID BITUMINOUS MATERIAL(S) 
BID DATE:  1/30/2025 

CONTRACT PERIOD:  DATE OF AWARD – 12/31/2025 
 
 
 

 
                                                                             
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

MULTIPLE AWARD BASED ON AVAILABILITY 
 

LABOR RATES 

MIDLAND ASPHALT SUIT-KOTE VESTAL 

NB $ 150.00 / hr. $ 150.00 / hr. 
 

Rental Equipment 

 MIDLAND ASPHALT SUIT-KOTE VESTAL ASPHALT 

Equipment Type $ per Gal. $ per Day $ per Week $ per Gal. $ per Day $ per Week $ per  
Gal. $ per Day $ per Week 

Mechanized Chip Spreader $ .30 $ 3,000.00 NO BID $ .260 $ 2,600.00 NO BID NO BID $ 2,700.00 NO BID 

Tandem Steel Roller; 10-12 ton NO BID NO BID NO BID $ .240 $ 2,400.00    NO BID NO BID $ 2,500.00 NO BID 

Rubber Tire Roller; 10-12 ton $ .24 $ 2,400.00 NO BID $ .230 $ 2,300.00 NO BID NO BID $ 2,300.00 NO BID 

Vibratory Pad Foot Roller;  15 ton NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 3,000.00 NO BID 

Tandem Axle Dump Truck NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 2,000.00 NO BID 

Rubber Tire Loader - minimum 2 cy  
bucket NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 2,600.00 NO BID 

Paver – shall include operator and 
screed man. NO BID NO BID NO BID $ .370 $ 3,700.00 NO BID NO BID $ 4,000.00 NO BID 

Vibratory Roller - minimum 66” 
double drum NO BID NO BID NO BID $ .260 $ 2,600.00 NO BID NO BID $ 2,600.00 NO BID 

Pugmill – minimum 5000 gallon 
usage; shall include operator $ .32 $ 3,200.00 NO BID $ .300 $ 3,000.00 NO BID NO BID $ 3,000.00 NO BID 

Mix Paver – minimum 5000 gallon 
usage; shall include operator and 

screed man. 
$ .33 $ 3,300.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Mix Paver – for liquid asphalt cement 
foamed application; shall include 

operator and screed man. 
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Shoulder Widener NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 5,000.00 NO BID 

Nuclear Density Gauge; shall include 
operator NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID 


