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READY MIX CONCRETE 

BID DATE:  1/23/2025 
CONTRACT PERIOD:  DATE OF AWARD – 12/31/2025 

 

Custom Mix Concrete, Inc., 1229 Lowman Road, Lowman, NY 14861 (607) 737-0281 
Heidelberg Materials Northeast, 6895 Ellicott Street, Pavilion, NY 14525 (585) 584-3132 / (585) 584-8743 
Spallina Materials, Inc. PO Box 89, West Bloomfield, NY 14585 (585) 657-8001 / (585) 657-6575 
 

QUADRANT 1 

 CUSTOM MIX 
CONCRETE HEIDELBERG SPALLINA 

NYSDOT Class A for Structures $ 174.00 / cy $ 190.00 / cy NO BID 

NYSDOT Class H for Structures $ 179.00 / cy $ 200.00 / cy NO BID 

NYSDOT Controlled Low Strength Material (CLSM) $ 150.00 / cy $ 170.00 / cy NO BID 

3000 psi concrete $ 158.00 / cy $ 185.00 / cy NO BID 

Conveyer Truck Delivery. (if needed) $ 300.00 / hr. $ 375.00 / hr. NO BID 
 

QUADRANT 2 

 CUSTOM MIX 
CONCRETE HEIDELBERG SPALLINA 

NYSDOT Class A for Structures $ 174.00 / cy $ 190.00 / cy NO BID 

NYSDOT Class H for Structures $ 179.00 / cy $ 200.00 / cy NO BID 

NYSDOT Controlled Low Strength Material (CLSM) $ 150.00 / cy $ 170.00 / cy NO BID 

3000 psi concrete $ 158.00 / cy $ 185.00 / cy NO BID 

Conveyer Truck Delivery. (if needed) $ 300.00 / hr. $ 375.00 / hr. NO BID 

 
MULTIPLE AWARD based on low bid, contingent on awardee’s ability to batch, deliver and discharge within specified time limitations. 
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READY MIX CONCRETE 
BID DATE:  1/23/2025 

CONTRACT PERIOD:  DATE OF AWARD – 12/31/2025 
 

QUANDRANT 3 

 CUSTOM MIX 
CONCRETE HEIDELBERG SPALLINA 

NYSDOT Class A for Structures $ 174.00 / cy $ 190.00 / cy $ 240.00 / cy 

NYSDOT Class H for Structures $ 179.00 / cy $ 200.00 / cy $ 250.00 / cy 

NYSDOT Controlled Low Strength Material (CLSM) $ 150.00 / cy $ 170.00 / cy $ 185.00 / cy 

3000 psi $ 158.00 / cy $ 185.00 / cy $ 229.00 / cy 

Conveyer Truck Delivery. (if needed) $ 300.00 / hr. $ 375.00 / hr. $ 360.00 / hr. 

 
 

QUADRANT 4 

 CUSTOM MIX 
CONCRETE HEIDELBERG SPALLINA 

NYSDOT Class A for Structures $ 174.00 / cy $ 190.00 / cy $ 255.00 / cy 

NYSDOT Class H for Structures $ 179.00 / cy $ 200.00 / cy $ 264.00 / cy 

NYSDOT Controlled Low Strength Material (CLSM) $ 150.00 / cy $ 170.00 / cy $ 198.00 / cy 

3000 psi $ 158.00 / cy $ 185.00 / cy $ 242.00 / cy  

Conveyer Truck Delivery. (if needed) $ 300.00 / hr. $ 375.00 / hr. $ 360.00 / hr. 

         
MULTIPLE AWARD based on low bid, contingent on awardee’s ability to batch, deliver and discharge within specified time limitations. 

 
 

AWARDED BY THE PWC ON 2/3/2025 AS SHADED 


