
PW-24-048-B2 

CONVENTIONAL DAY CAB ROAD TRACTOR(S) 
BID DATE 7/30/2024 

 
Dimmick Group Peterbilt, 472 Summit Point Drive, Henrietta, NY 14467 (585) 321-5250 / (585) 321-5251 
Regional International Corp., 1007 Lehigh Station Road, Henrietta, NY 14467 (607) 438-7700 / (585) 359-2418 
Tracey Road Equipment, Inc., 6803 Manlius Center Road, East Syracuse, NY 13057 (585) 278-8840 

 
 Dimmick Group Peterbilt Regional International Tracey Road Equipment 

Quantity 
In toto price 

per Complete 
unit 

Total 
Extended Line 
Item Price Bid 

In toto price 
per Complete 

unit 

Total 
Extended Line 
Item Price Bid 

In toto price 
per Complete 

unit 

Total 
Extended Line 
Item Price Bid 

1 $ 167,210.00 $ 167,210.00 $ 192,636.63 $ 192,636.63 $ 184,365.00 $ 184,365.00 
2 $ 165,210.00 $ 332,420.00 $ 192,636.63 $ 385,273.26 $ 184,365.00 $ 368,730.00 
3 $ 163,210.00 $ 495,630.00 NO BID NO BID $ 184,365.00 $ 553,095.00 
4 $ 162,210.00 $ 657,840.00 NO BID NO BID $ 184,365.00 $ 737,460.00 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

AWARDED BY THE PWC ON 8/5/2024 AS SHADED 


