Guide Rail Materials
Bid Date: 2/8/2024

Chemung Supply Corp., PO Box 527, Elmira, NY 14902 (607) 733-5506 / (607) 732-5379
Eberl Iron Works, Inc., 128 Sycamore St., Buffalo, NY 14204 (716) 854-7633
Pavilion Drainage Supply Co., Inc., 6630 Ellicott St. Rd. Pavilion, NY 14525 (585) 584-3261 / (585) 584-3812

D - Quantity Unit Chemung Supply Eberl Iron Works Pavilion Drainage Supply
escription of Each | Measure | Inr Toto Price In Toto Price In Toto Price In Toto Price In Toto Price In Toto Price
Bid per Each Bid per Each Bid per Each Bid per Each Bid per Each Bid per Each
Corrugated Beam Guide Rail:
136 27 length, (5) slotted holes for 3 1/2” post 600 each $172.35 $103,410.00 NO BID NO BID $ 125.00 $ 75,000.00
spacing
Corrugated Beam Terminal Rail
13°6 4 length, (3) slotted holes for 6°- 3” post spacing, 13 each $ 189.00 $2,457.00 NO BID NO BID $ 166.50 $2,164.50
(11) 1” diam. holes
Corrugated Beam Driveway Terminal Rail
13'6" length, shop curved rail, (2) slotted holes, (11) 17 20 each $ 189.00 $ 3,780.00 NO BID NO BID $ 187.50 $ 3,750.00
diam. holes
e e (cap) at Anchor 25 each | $5590 | $1397.50 | NOBID NO BID $9350 | $2,337.50
Box Beam Shelf Angle for end post
57x 3% 7 x 3/8” x 4” 50 each $ 14.50 $ 725.00 NO BID NO BID $ 14.60 $ 730.00
with (3) 13/16” diam. holes and (2) 5/8” diam. holes
Box Beam Splice Plate (straight) with Tapped Bolt
Holes
273" x 5 7/16” x 5/8” bent plate with (8) 5/8” diam. 100 each NB NB NB NB NB NB
holes
Box Beam Splice Plate Bolt
3/4" diam., 1 %" long ASTM A325 bolt with F436 wide 500 each NB NB NB NB NB NB
washer
Top Box Beam Guide Rail with 3 Horizontal
Holes and 2’ Post Spacing 8 each $ 736.80 $ 5,894.40 NO BID NO BID $ 815.00 $ 6,520.00
6” x6” x 24’
Box Beam Type I End Assembly
73" +/- length 20 each NB NB NB NB NB NB
3> Box Beam Straight Splice Tube for 67 x 67 24 each | $296.00 | $7,10400 | NOBID NO BID $238.00 | $5,712.00
Box Beam Splice Tube Carriage Bolt % “ diam., 7
147 long ASTM A325 bolt winut & (2) washers 100 each $11.60 $1,160.00 NO BID NO BID $9.55 $ 955.00
Box Beam Splice Tube Hex Head Bolt
% “ diam., 7 %5” long ASTM A325 Bolt W/Nut 100 each NB NB NB NB NB NB
& (2) Washers
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Pavilion Drainage

Chemung Supply Eberl Iron Works
Quantity Unit Supply
Description of Each | Measure In Toto In Toto In Toto In Toto In Toto In Toto
Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid
per Each per Each per Each per Each per Each per Each
Galvanized Heavy Post:
W 6x 8.5, 6’ length without soil plate, (4) 1000 each $78.40 $ 78,400.00 NO BID NO BID $ 83.50 $ 83,500.00
11/16” diam. holes
Galvanized Heavy Post:
W 6x 9, 6° length with soil plate, (2) 11/16” diam. 200 each $114.94 $22,988.00 NO BID NO BID $118.00 $23,600.00
holes
6” x 6” x 8” Galvanized Box Beam Blockouts 30 each $ 40.25 $ 1,207.50 NO BID NO BID $30.50 $ 915.00
Galvanized Universal Weak Post:
S 3x5.7, 5°-5” length with soil plate 500 each $ 74.55 $ 37,275.00 NO BID NO BID $ 82.00 $ 41,000.00
Plastic or Synthetic Blockout 6” x 7 %” x 14” 1500 each $6.50 $9,750.00 NO BID NO BID $9.10 $ 13,650.00
Guide Rail Delineator:
high intensity, double-faced and slotted for corrugated
beam guide rail mount, 100 white/yellow, 5 1/8 * x 2 150 each $6.50 $975.00 NO BID NO BID $7.10 $ 1,065.00
5/8”
Guide Rail Bolt for Heavy Posts
5/8” diam., 10” long bolt (nut & washer not required). 1000 each $3.95 $ 3,950.00 NO BID NO BID $6.20 $6,200.00
Steel Blockout, Galvanized
W 6x9, 12" length 100 each -0- -0- $7.92 $792.00 -0- -0-
Shop Curved Corrugated Beam Guide Rail;
13’ — 6” length:
Splice Bolt
5/8 «diam., 1 % long oval shoulder bolt with recessed 5000 each $1.25 $6,250.00 | $1.25 $ 6,250.00 $145 $ 7,250.00
hex nut
Support Bolt
1/2” diam., 1 %" long hex head bolt with square washer 1200 each $1.20 $1,440.00 | $3.87 $ 4,644.00 $1.80 $2,160.00
and hex nut.
Weak Post Bolt
5/16'diam., 1 %" long hex head bolt with square washer 500 each $1.25 $ 625.00 $5.84 2,920.00 $1.70 $ 850.00
Oval Washer 1000 | each $1.40 | $1,400.00 | $2.50 $2,500.00 | $1.75 | $1750.00
Total Extended Line Item Price Bid
(sum of all “Extended Line Item Price Bid”; include all Bid $290,188.40 $17,106.00 $279,109.00
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