TIRES & RECAPPING OF TIRES

All Season Tire, 7443 State Rte. 415 N, Bath, NY 14810 (607) 776-9621 / (607) 776-2461
Dunn Tire, 475 Cayuga Road, Buffalo, NY 14225 (716) 583-4122 / (716) 632-2608

Hess Tire, 2377 County Road 22, Andover NY 14806 (607) 478-8473 / (607) 478-8548
Lewis General Tires, Inc., 3870 W. Henrietta Road, Rochester, NY 14623 (585) 334-0900 / (585) 334-4615

NEW TIRES

ALL SEASON TIRE

BID DATE: 8/2/2018

ONE TIME PURCHASE

DUNN TIRE

PW-18-023-B

McCarthy Tire Service Company of NY, Inc., PO Box 1125, Wilkes-Barre, PA 18703 (570) 494-8368
Parmenter Inc., 103 Railroad St., PO Box 427, Odessa, New York 14869 (607) 594-7106 / (607) 594-7101
Sedam Tire, 3165 Route 246. P.O. Box 106, Perry, NY 14530 (585) 237-2124/(585) 237-6932

Tallmadge Tire Service of Cortland, 50 Groton Ave., Cortland, NY 13045 (607) 756-7559 / (607) 753-3223

HESS TIRE

LEWIS GENERAL TIRES**

TIRE SIZE

INTOTO
PRICE BID
PER TIRE

EXTENDED
LINE ITEM
PRICE BID

MEETS SPEC:
YES/NO

INTOTO
PRICE BID
PER TIRE

EXTENDED
LINE ITEM
PRICE BID

MEETS SPEC:
YES/NO

INTOTO
PRICE BID
PER TIRE

EXTENDED
LINE ITEM
PRICE BID

MEETS SPEC:
YES/NO

INTOTO
PRICE BID
PER TIRE

EXTENDED
LINE ITEM
PRICE BID

MEETS
SPEC:
YES/NO

11R-24.5

$ 355.00

$53.250.00

YES

$400.00

$ 60,000

YES

$357.53

$53,629.50%

YES

4.25-65-R22.5

$575.00

$ 23,000.00

YES

$675.00

$27,000.00

YES

$575.00

$ 23,000.00

YES

275-70-R22.5

$290.00

$5,800.00

YES

$346.58

$6,931.60

YES

$290.00

$5,800.00

YES

255-70-R22.5

$249.00

$1,494.00

YES

$ 288.56

$1,731.36

YES

$249.00

$1,494.00

YES

275-70-R18

$148.22

$2,964.40

YES

$189.60

$3,792.00

YES

$148.22

$2,964.40

YES

245-75-R22.5

$295.00

$1,180.00

YES

$339.54

$1,358.16

$339.54

$1,358.16

YES

$295.00

$1,180.00

YES

245-70-R17

$128.01

$4,608.36

YES

$171.43

$6,171.48

YES

$128.01

$ 4,608.36

YES

10.00R-22.5

$272.00

$544.00

YES

$381.70

$763.40

YES

$272.00

$544.00

YES

10.00R-22.5

$295.00

$1,180.00

YES

$314.00

$1,256.00

$378.21

$1,512.84

YES

$295.00

$1,180.00

YES

235-75-R15

$74.11

$592.88

YES

$131.42

$1,051.36

YES

$74.11

$592.88

YES

265-70-R17

$127.37

$764.22

YES

$179.33

$1,075.98

YES

$127.37

$764.22

YES

1400R-24

$900.00

$5,400.00

YES

$1,175.00

$ 7,050.00

YES

23.5R-25

$1,350.00

$ 5,400.00

YES

$1,350.00

$5,400.00

YES

12R-16.5

$118.00

$708.00

YES

$165.00

$990.00

YES

1800-25

$1,300.00

$1,300.00

YES

$1,800.00

$1,800.00

YES

10.00R-20

$290.00

$2,320.00

YES

$400.00

$ 3,200.00

YES

7.50-15

$150.00

$300.00

YES

$200.00

$400.00

YES

245-55-R18

$142.55

$ 14,255.00

*  As Calculated by Steuben County
** Non responsive. Did not provide Bid Bond

YES

$142.55

$ 14,255.00

$142.55

$ 14,255.00

AWARDED BY THE PWC ON 8/6/2018 AS SHADED

$142.55

$ 14,255.00

YES



PW-18-023-B

TIRES & RECAPPING OF TIRES
BID DATE: 8/2/2018
ONE TIME PURCHASE

NEW TIRES

TALLMADGE TIRE

McCARTHY TIRE

PARMENTER SEDAM TIRE

TIRE SIZE

INTOTO
PRICE BID
PER TIRE

EXTENDED
LINE ITEM
PRICE BID

MEETS SPEC:
YES/NO

IN TOTO
PRICE BID
PER TIRE

EXTENDED
LINE ITEM
PRICE BID

IN TOTO
PRICE BID
PER TIRE

EXTENDED
LINE ITEM
PRICE BID

IN TOTO
PRICE BID
PER TIRE

EXTENDED
LINE ITEM
PRICE BID

MEETS
SPEC:
YES/NO

11R-24.5

$315.00

$47,250.00

$349.35

$52,402.50

$294.80

$ 44,220.00

$305.00

$ 45,750.00

YES

4.25-65-R22.5

$510.00

$20,400.00

$625.00

$ 25,000.00

$530.00

$21,200.00

$570.00

$22,800.00

YES

275-70-R22.5

$295.00

$5900.00

$302.00

$6,040.00

$380.00

$7,600.00

YES

255-70-R22.5

$280.00

$1,680.00

$298.00

$1,788

YES

275-70-R18

$172.89

$ 3,457.80

$ 155.00

$ 3,100.00

$189.60

$3,792.00

YES

245-75-R22.5

$425.00

$1,700.00

$337.00

$1,348.00

245-70-R17

$141.78

$5,104.08

$124.97

$4,498.92

$171.43

$6,171.48

10.00R-22.5

$290.07

$580.14

$293.00

$586.00

10.00R-22.5

$368.63

$1,474.52

$317.00

$1,268.00

235-75-R15

$103.13

$825.04

$142.88

$1,143.04

265-70-R17

$151.47

$908.82

$141.50

$849.00

$161.95

$971.70

1400R-24

$895.00

$5,370.00

$1,011.00

$ 6,066.00

23.5R-25

$1,595.00

$ 6,380.00

$1,489.00

$5,956.00

12R-16.5

$119.86

$719.16

$107.57

$645.42

1800-25

$1,472.53

$1,472.53

$1,379.00

$1,379.00

10.00R-20

$295.00

$2,360.00

7.50-15

$175.09

$350.18

$143.36

$286.72

245-55-R18

$146.07

$ 14,607.00

$ 140.55

$ 14,055.00

AWARDED BY THE PWC ON 8/6/2018 AS SHADED




TIRES & RECAPPING OF TIRES
BID DATE: 8/2/201
ONE TIME PURCHASE

RECAPPING OF TIRES

PW-18-023-B

ALL SEASON
TIRE

DUNN TIRE

LEWIS
GENERAL
TIRE

McCARTHY

HESS TIRE TIRE

PARMENTER

SEDAM

TALLMADGE

TIRE SIZE

UNIT

UNIT

UNIT UNIT UNIT

UNIT

UNIT

UNIT

11R-24.5

PER TIRE

PER TIRE

PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE

PER TIRE

PER TIRE

PER TIRE

P-124 SIERRA
TREAD 22/32
FLAT CAP

$125.00

NO BID

$237.00 $ 148.00 $ 126.00

$ 149.86

$ 138.50

$120.00

NAIL HOLES

NO CHARGE

NO BID

$26.00 $ 15.00 NO CHARGE

$3.95

NO CHARGE

$0.00-FIRST
$1.45 EA.
ADDITIONAL

SPOT REPAIRS

$ 14.00

NO BID

$ 35.00 $ 15.00 NO CHARGE

NO CHARGE

NO CHARGE

NO CHARGE

SECTION REPAIRS

$7.00

NO BID

$75.00 $22.00 NO CHARGE

Contract term for repair and recapping of tires is from date of award through December 31, 2018.
Tire repairs will be considered for bid award purposes.
Note: Tire repairs will be done at the time of recapping.

AWARDED BY THE PWC ON 8/6/2018 AS SHADED

$15.95

NO CHARGE

$5.00




