
3/14/19 

 
PW-19-038-B 

STEEL SIGN POSTS; REPLACEMENT PARTS  
BID DATE: 3/14/2019 

CONTRACT TERM: 4/1/2019 – 12/31/2019 
 

 
Chemung Supply Corp., PO Box 527, Elmira, NY 14902 (607) 733-5506 / (607) 732-5379 
Eberl Iron Works, Inc., 128 Sycamore St., Buffalo, NY 14204 (716) 854-7633 / (716) 854-1184 
Garden State Highway Products, Inc. 1740 E. Oak Road, Vineland, NJ 08361 (856) 692-7572 / (856) 692-6797 
 

 CHEMUNG EBERL GARDEN STATE HWY 

Item  Unit of Measure In Toto Price Bid per  
Unit of Measure 

In Toto Price Bid per  
Unit of Measure 

In Toto Price Bid per 
 Unit of Measure 

Sign Posts and Related Parts; Configuration #1:    

Delineator Post(s) – 1.12#/ft. Linear Foot NO BID $ 1.20 / lf $ 1.41 / lf 

Sign Post(s) or Base Post(s) – 4#/ft. Linear Foot NO BID $ 3.76 / lf $ 4.43 / lf 

“Lap Splice” Hardware One (1) Complete Set NO BID $ 5.93 / set $ 4.42 / set 

Sign Posts and Related Parts; Configuration #2:    

Delineator Post(s) – 1.12#/ft. Linear Foot $ 1.15 / lf $ 1.20 / lf $ 1.43 / lf 

Sign Post(s) or Base Post(s) – 4#/ft. Linear Foot $ 4.45 / lf NO BID * $ 4.56 / lf 

“EZE-Erect” Hardware One (1) Complete Set $ 12.75 / set NO BID * $ 14.96 / set 

Studded “T” (TEE) Posts – 1.33#/ft. Linear Foot NO BID NO BID $ 2.34 / lf 

“Z” (ZEE) Stringers – 1#/ft. Linear Foot $ 4.80 / lf $ 4.15 / lf $ 6.21 / lf 

 
* Non-responsive bidder.  Must bid all line items in said configuration 1 and 2. 
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