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                                                                                    MULTIPLE AWARD FROM LOW TO HIGH BASED ON AVAILABILITY                                                     PW-19-034-B 

ASPHALT CONCRETE; MISCELLANEOUS IN-PLACE PROJECTS  
Bid Date: 3/14/2019 

Contract Term: 4/1/2019 – 12/31/2019 
 

Bothar Construction, LLC, 170 E. Service Rd., Binghamton, NY 13901 (607) 723-5012 / (607) 723-4982 
Dalrymple Gravel and Contracting Co. Inc., 2105 S. Broadway, Pine City, NY 14871 (607) 737-6200 / (607) 767-0841 
Dolomite Products Co. Inc.,  DBA A.L. Blades., 7610 County Route 65, Hornell, NY 14843 (607) 324-3636 / (607) 324-0998 
Spallina Materials, Inc., PO Box 337, Mt. Morris, NY 14510 (585) 658-2248 / (585) 658-4054 
 

Location Unit Quantity BOTHAR DALRYMPLE DOLOMITE SPALLI NA 

Quadrant 1 ton, in-place < 150 $ 190.00 $ 200.00 $ 225.00 NO BID 

 
151 – 500 $ 100.00 $ 130.00 $ 118.00 NO BID 

> 500 $ 85.00 $ 90.00 $ 99.00 NO BID 

Quadrant 2 ton, in-place < 150 $ 190.00 $ 225.00 $ 225.00 NO BID 

 

151 – 500 $ 150.00 $ 150.00 $ 118.00 NO BID 

> 500 $ 100.00 $ 99.00 $ 99.00 NO BID 

Quadrant 3 ton, in-place < 150 $ 190.00 $ 250.00 $ 225.00 $ 235.00 

 
151 – 500 $ 150.00 $ 200.00 $ 118.00 $ 115.00 

> 500 $ 100.00 $ 150.00 $ 99.00 $ 99.00 

Quadrant 4 ton, in-place < 150 $ 190.00 $ 225.00 $ 225.00 $ 235.00 

 
151 – 500 $ 150.00 $ 150.00 $ 118.00 $ 117.00 

> 500 $ 100.00 $ 99.00 $ 99.00 $ 101.00 
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AWARDED BY THE PWC ON 4/1/19. 
 

QUADRANT 1 QUADRANT 2 QUADRANT 3 QUADRANT 4 

Addison 
Campbell 
Caton 
Corning 
Erwin 
Hornby 
Lindley 
Rathbone 
Thurston 
Tuscarora 

Cameron 
Canisteo 
Greenwood 
Hartsville 
Jasper 
Troupsburg 
West Union 
Woodhull 

Avoca 
Cohocton 
Dansville 
Fremont 
Hornellsville 
Howard 
Wayland 

Bath 
Bradford 
Prattsburgh 
Pulteney 
Urbana 
Wayne 
Wheeler 


