
4/25/2019 

                                                                                                                                                        AWARDED BY THE PWC ON 5/6/2019 AS SHADED                                                                                                    PW-19-049-B 

TRAFFIC CONTROL SUPPLIES 
BID DATE: 4/25/2019 

Shirley’s Lumber, 7285 Route 54, Bath, NY 14810 (607) 776-2051 / (607) 776-6802         

Signs & Safety Equipment, Inc., 95 Hibbord Road, Big Flats, NY 14814 (607) 562-8463 / (607) 562-8183 

The Big Green Sign Company, 1801 Academy Avenue Ext., Dublin GA, 31021 (770) 333-1635 / (770) 333-1639 

 Shirley’s of Bath Shirley’s of Bath 
alternate bid #1 

Shirley’s of Bath 
alternate bid #2 

Signs & Safety 

Equipment, Inc. 

The Big Green Sign 
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1 Breakaway Barricade each - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - 

2 Barricade Flashing Amber Light each - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - 

3 Fluorescent Vest; Light Weight each - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - 

4 Fluorescent Vest; Heavy Duty each 80 
(1) $ 6.98 $ 558.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 11.25 $ 900.00 NO BID NO BID 

5 Hard Hat each 50 $ 9.74 $ 487.00 $ 8.98 $ 449.00 NO BID NO BID $ 7.43 $ 371.50 NO BID NO BID 

6 Roll-Up Sign; Non- Reflective each - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - 

7 Roll-Up Sign; Reflective each 30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 48.75 $ 1,462.50 $ 55.99 $ 1,678.50 

8 Roll-Up Sign Stand each 25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 89.75 $ 2,243.75 $ 54.00 * $ 1,350.00 * 

9 Safety Fence 50’ roll - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - 

10 Traffic Barrel each - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - 

11 Ballasting Collar each - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - 

12 Traffic Con- 28” Slim Line each - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - 

13 Traffic Cone p/n 36 po64-tc2 each 250 $ 16.39 $ 4097.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 20.28 $ 5,070.00 $ 18.16 $ 4,540.00 

14 Warning Flag each - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - 

15 Warning Flag-solid (non-mesh) each - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - 

16 6 Volt Battery each - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - 

17 Stop/Slow Paddle each - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - 

18 Reflective Collars; 4” width pieces - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - 

19 Reflective Collars; 6” width pieces - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - - 0 - 

20 Mechanics Work Gloves pair 100
(2) $ 9.77 $ 977.00 $ 8.70  $ 870.00  $ 8.29 * $ 829.00 * $ 17.21 $ 1,721.00 NO BID NO BID 

21 Artic Thermal Gloves pair 200
(3) $ 5.59 $ 1,118.00 $ 5.40 $ 1,080.00 NO BID NO BID $ 8.00 $ 1,600.00 NO BID NO BID 

(1) 
Quantity per size shall be: 25 Large, 25 X-Large, 10 2X-Large, 10 3X-Large, 10 4X-Large; total quantity shall equal 80 vests. 

(2) Quantity per size shall be: 100 pair of X-Large; total quantity shall equal 100 pairs of glove 
(3) Quantity per size shall be: 50 pair of large gloves, 150 pair of XL gloves; total quantity shall equal 200 pair of gloves. 

* Does not meet specs 


