3/26/2019

CRUSHED LIMESTONE
BipD DATE: 3/26/2019

Dolomite Products Company, Inc. dba A.L. Blades, 7610 Co. Rte. 65, Hornell, NY 14843 (607) 324-3636 / (607) 324-0998
Hanson Aggregates New York, LLC, 6895 Ellicott Street, Pavilion, New York 14525 (585) 584-3132 / (585) 584-8743
Seneca Stone Corporation, 2105 S. Broadway, Pine City, New York 14871 (607) 737-6200 / (607) 737-1056

Estimated Quantity SENECA STONE DOLOMITE HANSON *

Delivery Site

per Material Type

Size 1A Size 1ST

In Toto Price Bid

per Ton

Extended Line Item

Price Bid

In Toto Price Bid

per Ton

Extended Line Item

Price Bid

In Toto Price Bid

per Ton

Extended Line Item
Price Bid

Greenwood Shop

150

$26.00/ ton

$ 3,900.00

$25.50/ ton

$ 3,825.00

$28.00/ ton

$ 4,200.00

-0-

-0-

-0-

-0-

-0-

-0-

Howard Shop

1,100

$23.50/ ton

$ 25,850.00

$23.50/ ton

$ 25,850.00

$26.50 / ton

$29,150.00

-0-

-0-

-0-

-0-

-0-

-0-

Cohocton Shop

1,160

$23.00/ ton

$ 26,680.00

$23.50/ ton

$ 27,260.00

$24.00/ ton

$ 27,840.00

$22.50/ ton

$ 29,250.00

$23.00/ ton

$29,900.00

NO BID

NO BID

Bridge Shop

500

$24.00/ ton

$ 12,000.00

$24.75/ ton

$ 12,375.00

$30.00/ ton

$ 15,000.00

-0-

-0-

-0-

-0-

-0-

-0-

Mt. Washington Shop

$23.00/ ton

$2,875.00

$24.50/ ton

$3,062.50

$26.00/ ton

$ 3,250.00

-0-

-0-

-0-

-0-

-0-

-0-

Caton Shop

-0-

-0-

-0-

-0-

-0-

-0-

-0-

-0-

-0-

-0-

-0-

-0-

Woodhull Shop

$24.25/ ton

$ 24,250.00

$ 25.50/ ton

$ 25,500.00

$29.00/ ton

$29,000.00

$23.75/ ton

$ 10,925.00

$25.00/ ton

$ 11,500.00

NO BID

NO BID

Curtis Shop

$22.50/ ton

$7,875.00

$ 25.50/ ton

$ 8,925.00

$28.00/ ton

$9,800.00

Prattsburgh Shop

Total Extended Line Item Price Bid:

* Non responsive bidder

AWARDED BY THE PWC ON 4/1/19 AS SHADED.

$ 118,240.00

PW-19-030-B




