
PW-19-023-B                              
 

TIRES & RECAPPING OF TIRES 
BID DATE: 8/29/19 

ONE TIME PURCHASE 
 
 
All Season Tire, 7443 St Rt. 415 North, Bath, NY 14810 (607) 776-9621 / (607) 776-2461 
Lewis General Tires, Inc., 3870 W. Henrietta Rd., Rochester, NY 14623 (585) 334-0900 / (585) 334-4615 
Parmenter Inc., 103 Railroad Street, Odessa, NY 14869-0427 (607) 594-7106 / (607) 594-7100 
Sedam Tire, 3165 Rt. 246, Perry, NY 14530 ( 585) 237-3744 / (585) 237-6932 
Tallmadge Tire Service of Cortland NY, 50 Groton Avenue, Cortland, NY 13045 (607) 756-7559 / (607)753-3223 
 

 
* Does not meet tier 1 and/or tier 2 specifications. 
** Does not meet specification-Closed shoulder design. 

 
 

NEW TIRES 
 ALL SEASON LEWIS GENERAL TIRES PARMENTER SEDAM TIRE TALLMADGE 

TIRE SIZE QTY IN TOTO PRICE 
BID PER TIRE 

EXTENDED 
LINE ITEM  
PRICE BID 

MEETS 
SPEC: 

YES/NO 

IN TOTO 
PRICE BID 
PER TIRE 

EXTENDED 
LINE ITEM  
PRICE BID 

MEETS 
SPEC: 

YES/NO 

IN TOTO 
PRICE BID 
PER TIRE 

EXTENDED 
LINE ITEM  
PRICE BID 

MEETS 
SPEC: 

YES/NO 

IN TOTO PRICE 
BID PER TIRE 

EXTENDED 
LINE ITEM  
PRICE BID 

MEETS 
SPEC: 

YES/NO 

IN TOTO 
PRICE BID 
PER TIRE 

EXTENDED 
LINE ITEM  
PRICE BID 

MEETS 
SPEC: 

YES/NO 

11R-24.5 100 $345.00 $34,500.00 YES $339.00 $33,900.00 YES $315.00 $31,500.00 YES $335.00 $33,500.00 YES $305.00 $30,500.00 YES 

315-80-R22.5 10 $450.00 $4,500.00 YES $467.00 $4,670.00 YES $415.11* $4,151.10 YES $448.50 $4,485.00 YES $480.00 $ 4,800 YES 

4.25-65-R22.5 30 $550.00* $16,500.00 YES $600.00 $18,000.00 YES $504.20* $15,126.00 YES $575.20 $17,256.00 YES $575.00 $17,250.00 YES 

275-70-R22.5 9 $375.00 $3,375.00 YES $421.00 $3,789.00 YES $290.08* $2,610.72 YES $345.00 $3,105.00 YES $395.00 $ 3,555.00 YES 

245-75-R17 8 $130.00 $1,040.00 YES $160.00 $1,280.00 YES $128.00* $1,024.00 YES $133.00 $1,064.00 YES $125.00** $ 1,000.00 YES 

245-75-R22.5 4 $349.00 $1,396.00 YES $353.00 $1,412.00 YES $269.56* $1,078.24 YES $352.00 $1,408.00 YES NO BID NO BID NO BID 

10.00-20 16 $360.00 $5,760.00 YES $390.00 $6,240.00 YES NO BID NO BID NO BID $345.00 $5,520.00 YES NO BID NO BID NO BID 

245-70-R17 40 $125.00 $5,000.00 YES $135.00 $5,400.00 YES $122.22* $4,888.80 YES $127.50 $5,100.00 YES $131.83 $5,273.20 YES 

10.00R-22.5 4 $299.00 $1,196.00 YES $393.34 $1,573.36 YES NO BID NO BID NO BID $393.34 $1,573.36 YES $315.00 $1,260.00 YES 

235-75-R15 9 $125.00 $1,125.00 YES NO BID NO BID NO BID $88.88* $799.92 YES $107.00 $963.00 YES NO BID NO BID NO BID 

265-70-R17 4 $135.00 $540.00 YES NO BID NO BID NO BID $126.57* $506.28 YES $146.00 $584.00 YES $141.52 $566.08 YES 

1800-25 1 $1,495.00* $1,495.00 YES $1,385.00* $1,385.00 YES   $1,375.00* $1,375.00 YES $2,453.00* $2,453.00 YES $1,485.00* $1,485.00 YES 

245-55-R18 100 $139.00 $13,900.00 YES $144.00 $14,400.00 YES NO BID NO BID NO BID $142.00 $14,200.00 YES NO BID NO BID NO BID 

275-70-R18 36 $160.00 $5,760.00 YES $184.00 $6,624.00 YES $161.82 $5,825.52 YES $160.30 $5,770.80 YES $173.65 $6,251.40 YES 

245-70R-19.5 8 $280.00 $2,240.00 YES $285.00 $2,280.00 YES NO BID NO BID NO BID $250.00 $2,000.00 YES $260.00 $2,080.00 YES 



PW-19-023-B      
 

TIRES & RECAPPING OF TIRES 
BID DATE: 8/29/19 
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 * Not all tires require a 9 “casing. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

AWARDED BY THE PWC ON 9/9/19 AS SHADED  

RECAPPING OF TIRES 

 ALL SEASON LEWIS 
GENERAL PARMENTER SEDAM TIRE TALLMADGE 

TIRE SIZE UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT 

11R-24.5 PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE 

P-124 SIERRA 
TREAD 22/32 

FLAT CAP 
*$ 119.00 (9”WIDE CASING)              

$132.00 (ALL OTHER WIDTHS) 
$ 145.00 $ 119.89 $ 153.00 $ 120.00 

NAIL HOLES NO CHARGE NO CHARGE $ 3.95 NO CHARGE 
$0.00 1st tire  
$1.45 each 

additional tire 

SPOT REPAIRS NO CHARGE NO CHARGE NO CHARGE NO CHARGE NO CHARGE 

SECTION REPAIRS NO CHARGE NO CHARGE $ 15.00 NO CHARGE $ 5.00 


