
6/15/23 

  PW-23-049-B 
 

TRAFFIC CONTROL SUPPLIES 
BID DATE: 6/15/2023 

S&S Signs & Safety Equipment, 1400 Sullivan Street, Elmira, NY 14901 (607) 562-8463 / (607) 562-8183 
Safety Zone Specialists, PO Box 90764, Lakeland Florida, 33804 (863) 816-3402 / (863) 816-3437 
 

 SIGNS & SAFETY 
EQUIPMENT 

SAFETY ZONE 
SPECIALISTS 

Line Item Number Product Name Unit of 
Measure Qty. In Toto Price 

per Unit 

Extended 
Line Item 
Price Bid 

In Toto Price 
per Unit 

Extended 
Line Item 
Price Bid 

1 Breakaway Barricade each - 0 -     

2 Barricade Flashing Amber Light each 25 $ 28.60 $ 715.00 * $ 18.95 $ 473.75 

3 Fluorescent Vest; Light Weight each 60 $ 12.35 $ 741.00 * $ 8.00 $ 480.00 

4 Fluorescent Vest; Heavy Duty each - 0 -     

5 Hard Hat each 30 $ 15.00 $ 450.00 * $ 13.25 $ 397.50 

6 Roll-Up Sign; Non- Reflective each - 0 -     

7 Roll-Up Sign; Reflective each 30 $ 52.50 $ 1,575.00 * $ 92.70 $ 2,781.00 

8 Roll-Up Sign Stand each 30 $ 88.85 $ 2,665.50 * $ 138.45 $ 4,153.50 

9 Safety Fence 50’ roll - 0 -     

10 Traffic Barrel each - 0 -     

11 Ballasting Collar each 30 $ 4.00 $ 120.00 * No Bid No Bid 

12 Traffic Cone- 28” Slim Line each 25 No Bid No Bid $ 19.00 $ 475.00 

13 Traffic Cone p/n 36 po64-tc2 each 200 $ 20.89 $ 4,178.00 * $ 20.75 $ 4,150.00 

14 Warning Flag each - 0 -     

15 Warning Flag-solid (non-mesh) each 50 $ 5.50 $ 275.00 * $ 4.75 $ 237.50 

16 6 Volt Battery each 40 $ 4.50 $ 180.00 * No Bid No Bid 

17 Stop/Slow Paddle each - 0 -     

18 Reflective Collars; 4” width pieces - 0 -     

19 Reflective Collars; 6” width pieces - 0 -     

20 Mechanics Work Gloves pair 20 $ 10.70 $ 214.00 * $ 7.80 $ 156.00 

21 Artic Thermal Gloves pair 100 (1) $ 4.00 $ 400.00 * $ 8.50 $ 850.00 

(1) Quantity per size shall be: 100 pair of XL gloves; total quantity shall equal 100 pair of gloves. 
* As calculated by Steuben County 

 
 

AWARDED BY THE PWC ON 7/3/23 AS SHADED 


