ONE TIME PURCHASE

TIRES & RECAPPING OF TIRES
BID DATE: 9/8/22

Parmenter Inc., 103 Railroad Street, Odessa, NY 14869-0427 (607) 594-7106 / (607) 594-7100
Sedam Tire, 3165 Rt. 246, Perry, NY 14530 (585) 237-2124 / (585) 237-6932
Tallmadge Tire Service of Cortland NY, 50 Groton Avenue, Cortland, NY 13045 (607) 756-7559 / (607)753-3223

PARMENTER

SEDAM

TALLMADGE

TIRE SIZE

IN TOTO
PRICE BID
PER TIRE

EXTENDED
LINE ITEM
PRICE BID

MEETS
SPEC:
YES/NO

IN TOTO
PRICE BID
PER TIRE

EXTENDED
LINE ITEM
PRICE BID

IN TOTO
PRICE BID
PER TIRE

EXTENDED
LINE ITEM
PRICE BID

MEETS SPEC.

YES/NO

11R-24.5

$489.91

$ 14,697.30

YES

$569.17

$17,075.10

$ 347.00

$10,410.00

YES

315-80-R22.5

$625.19

$6,251.90

YES

$492.83

$4,928.30

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

4.25-65-R22.5

$ 808.65

$20,216.25

YES

$757.62

$ 18,940.50

$ 655.00

$16,375.00

YES

275-70-R22.5

$615.65

$7,387.80

YES

$ 381.95

$4,583.40

$ 450.00

$5,400.00

YES

245-75-R17

$160.80

$964.80

YES

$161.21

$967.26

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

245-70-R17

$142.40

$4,272.00

YES

$164.50

$4,935.00

Response

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

265-70-R17

$168.00

$2,016.00

YES

$170.36

$2,044.32

YES

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

245-55-R18

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$161.16

$ 8,058.00

YES

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

275-70-R18

$200.00

$ 6,400.00

YES

$208.00

$ 6,656.00

YES

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

11.00R-22.5

$565.12

$4,520.96

YES

$359.93

$2,879.44

YES

$ 415.00

$3,320.00

YES

PW-22-023-B



TIRES & RECAPPING OF TIRES

PARMENTER

BID DATE: 9/8/22
ONE TIME PURCHASE

SEDAM TIRE

TALLMADGE

TIRE SIZE

UNIT

UNIT

UNIT

11R-24.5

PER TIRE

PER TIRE

PER TIRE

P-124 SIERRA
TREAD 22/32
FLAT CAP

$ 135.69

$172.00

$ 143.00

Nail Holes

No Charge

No Charge

No Charge

Spot Repairs

No Charge

No Charge

No Charge

Total
Section Repairs
(Per tire)

No Charge

AWARDED BY THE PUBLIC WORKS COMMITTEE ON 9/12/22

No Charge

$5.00

PW-22-023-B



