2/27/2020
L1QUID BITUMINOUS MATERIAL(S)
BID DATE: 2/27/2020
CONTRACT PERIOD: 3/2/2020 - 12/31/2020

Midland Asphalt Materials, Inc., 640 Young Street, Tonawanda, New York 14150 (716) 692-0730 / (716) 692-0613
Suit-Kote Corporation, 20 Fairground Lane, Watkins Glen, New York 14891 (607) 535-2743 / (607) 535-6996
Vestal Asphalt, Inc., 201 Stage Road, Vestal, New York 13850 (607) 785-3393 / (607) 785-3396

FOB - Plant Site

: MIDLAND ASPHALT SUIT-KOTE VESTAL ASPHALT

Material In Toto Price Bid In Toto Price Bid In Toto Price Bid
Description per Gallon per Gallon per Gallon

702-3301 $ 2.53 / gallon $1.913 /gallon $3.000 / gallon

PLANT SITE (Locatlon) Lyons NY Watklns Glen, NY Vestal NY

Used for pothole patching machine.

MULTIPLE AWARD BASIS

AWARDED BY THE PWC ON 3/2/2020 AS SHADED
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MC-30

L1QUID BITUMINOUS MATERIAL(S)

BID DATE: 2/14/2019
CONTRACT PERIOD: 3/4/2019 -12/31/2019

Emulsion with Distributor

Material
Description

702-20

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

2/27/2020

MIDLAND ASPHALT SUIT-KOTE VESTAL ASPHALT

In Toto Price Bid In Toto Price Bid In Toto Price Bid
per Gallon per Gallon per Gallon

RS-2 (1)

702-3101

$2.915/ gallon

$1.963/ gallon

$1.874/ gallon

HFRS-2 (1)

702-3102

$2.915/ gallon

$2.110/ gallon

$3.038 / gallon

MS-2

702-3201

$3.274 / gallon

$2.591 / gallon

$3.410/ gallon

HFMS-2

702-3301

$3.274 / gallon

$2.429 / gallon

$3.410/ gallon

HFMS-2h

702-3401

$3.274 / gallon

$ 2.537 /gallon

$3.410/ gallon

HFMS-2s

702-3402

-0-

-0-

-0-

CRS-2 (1)

702-4101

$2.895 / gallon

$2.207 /gallon

$2.135/ gallon

CMS-2

702-4201

$ 3.254 / gallon

$2.750 /gallon

$3.390/ gallon

CMS-2h

702-4301

$ 3.254 / gallon

$ 2.750 /gallon

$3.390 / gallon

TACK COAT

702-90

$9.46 / gallon

$9.700 /gallon

$10.00 / gallon

ss1 ()

702-3501

$3.086 / gallon

$ 1.622 /gallon

$1.835/ gallon

SS-1H  (2)

702-3601

$3.086 / gallon

$ 2.467 /gallon

$2.514 / gallon

Css-1 (2

702-4401

$3.066 / gallon

$ 2.600 /gallon

$ 1.835 / gallon

CSS-1H (2)

702-4501

$3.066 / gallon

$ 2.652 / gallon

$2.494 / gallon

CQS-1H

702-4601

NO BID

$5.170 /gallon

$5.025 / gallon

(1) Rapid set liquid asphalt (RS-2, HFRS-2 and CRS-2) is used for chip seal surface treatments. RS-2 in 2020 (estimated/projected): 251,000 gallons.
(2) SS-1 are used as road grinder injection liquid asphalts. 2020 (estimated/projected): 326,000 gallons.
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2/27/2020

L1QUID BITUMINOUS MATERIAL(S)
BID DATE: 2/14/2019
CONTRACT PERIOD: 3/4/2019 -12/31/2019

Emulsion for Cold Mix

:| MIDLAND ASPHALT SUIT-KOTE VESTAL ASPHALT
Material In Toto Price Bid In Toto Price Bid In Toto Price Bid
Description per Gallon per Gallon per Gallon

MS-2 702-3201 $3.578 / gallon $ 2.691 /gallon $3.700 / gallon

HFMS-2 702-3301 $3.578/ gallon $ 2.529 /gallon $3.774 / gallon
HFMS-2h 702-3401 $3.578/ gallon $ 2.637 /gallon $3.774 / gallon

HFMS-2s (1) 702-3402 $3.71/ gallon $ 2.873 /gallon $3.774 / gallon
CMS-2 702-4201 $ 3.551 / gallon $ 2.850 /gallon $3.700 / gallon

CMS-2h 702-4301 $ 3.551/ gallon $ 2.850 /gallon $3.700/ gallon
(1) Only HEMS-2s will be acceptable for Cold Mix stockpile patch.
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2/27/2020

L1QUID BITUMINOUS MATERIAL(S)
BID DATE: 2/14/2019
CONTRACT PERIOD: 3/4/2019 -12/31/2019

Liquid Bituminous Material(s); AEPM

_ MIDLAND ASPHALT SUIT-KOTE VESTAL ASPHALT
ltem

In Toto Price Bid per Gallon In Toto Price Bid per Gallon In Toto Price Bid per Gallon

Emulsion with Distributor $2.27 / gallon $ 1.694 /gallon $ 1.657 /gallon
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2/27/2020
L1QUID BITUMINOUS MATERIAL(S)
BID DATE: 2/14/2019
CONTRACT PERIOD: 3/4/2019 - 12/31/2019

Rental Equipment
MIDLAND ASPHALT SUIT-KOTE VESTAL ASPHALT

Equipment Type $ per Gal. $perDay | $perWeek Jl $perGal. | $perDay | $per Week | $perGal. | $perDay | $per Week

Mechanized Chip Spreader $2,400.00 $2,400.00 $2,150.00 | $9,000.00

Tandem Steel Roller; 10-12 ton NO BID $2,300.00 $2,150.00 NO BID

Rubber Tire Roller; 10-12 ton NO BID $2,100.00 $2,150.00 NO BID

Vibratory Pad Foot Roller; 15 ton NO BID NO BID $2,150.00 NO BID

Tandem Axle Dump Truck NO BID $2,100.00 $1,350.00 NO BID

Rubber Tire Loader - minimum 2
cy bucket

Paver — shall include operator and
screed man.

Vibratory Roller - minimum 66”
double drum

Pugmill — minimum 5000 gallon
usage; shall include operator

Mix Paver — minimum 5000 gallon
usage; shall include operator and . $2,900.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
screed man.

Mix Paver - for liquid asphalt
cement foamed application; shall . $2,900.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
include operator and screed man.

Shoulder Widener NO BID NO BID $2150.00 NO BID

Nuclear Density Gauge; shall
include operator

NO BID $ 128.75 /per hour $ 150.00 /per hour

MULTIPLE AWARD

NO BID $ 2,400.00 $2,150.00 NO BID

NO BID : $ 3,200.00 $ 3,500.00 NO BID

NO BID : $2,300.00 $2,150.00 NO BID

$2,700.00 . $2,600.00 $2,150.00 NO BID

NO BID $2,884.00 NO BID NO BID
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