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ICE CONTROL SAND: FOB PLANT SITE 
BID DATE: 5/20/2021 

CONTRACT: 6/1/2021 – 4/30/2022                                                                             
 

Dalrymple Gravel & Contracting Co. Inc., 2105 S. Broadway, Pine City, NY 14871 (607) 737-6200 / (607) 767-0841 

Dolomite Products Company, Inc. dba A.L. Blades, 7610 County Rte. 65, Hornell, NY 14843 (607) 324-3636 / (607) 324-0998 

New Enterprise Stone & Lime Co. Inc., 500 Como Park Blvd., Buffalo, NY 14227 (716) 826-7310 / (716) 826-1342 

Spallina Materials, Inc., PO Box 89, West Bloomfield, NY 14858 (585) 657-8001 / (585) 657-6575 

ST Coots, LLC, 7421County Rte. 16, Bath, NY 14810 (607) 776-3903 / (607) 776-3919 

Wilkins Dairy Farm LLC / dba Wilkins Sand and Gravel, 5811 Unionville Road, Bath, NY 14810 (607) 776-4714 / (607) 776-4719 

 

 

ICE CONTROL SAND – FOB PLANT SITE 

 DALRYMPLE DOLOMITE 
NEW 

ENTERPRISE 

SPALLINA 

MATERIALS 
ST COOTS  WILKINS 

In Toto Price Bid 

Per Ton: 
$12.80 / ton $12.50 / ton $7.00 / ton $7.80 / ton $12.00 / ton $9.47 / ton 

Plant Site Name Coopers Plains 
Howard Sand & 

Gravel 
Alfred Station Cohocton Coots Gravel 

Wilkins Sand & 

Gravel 

Plant Site 

Location:  

Road, Town, 

State 

Curtis Coopers Rd. 

Painted Post, NY 

Mill Road 

Avoca, NY 

638 NY-244 

Alfred, NY 

Jones Road 

Cohocton, NY 

  

State Route 415 

Campbell, NY 

Moore Rd. 

Bath, NY 

 

AWARDED BY THE PWC ON 6/6/2021 

 

 

 

Multiple awards based on F.O.B. plus Steuben Co. DPW trucking cost.  
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ICE CONTROL SAND; DELIVERED TO COUNTY SHOPS  
BID DATE: 5/20/2021 

CONTRACT: 6/1/2021 – 4/30/2021 

 

 DALRYMPLE DOLOMITE 
NEW 

ENTERPRISE 

SPALLINA 

MATERIALS 
ST COOTS WILKINS 

Location       

Cameron (Bridge) 
 

NO BID NO BID $13.25 / ton $14.65 / ton NO BID NO BID 

Caton NO BID NO BID $17.25 / ton $16.10 / ton NO BID NO BID 

Cohocton 
 

NO BID NO BID $14.75 / ton $11.75 / ton NO BID NO BID 

Curtis NO BID NO BID $14.50 / ton $13.75 / ton NO BID NO BID 

Greenwood NO BID NO BID $12.25 / ton $15.70 / ton NO BID NO BID 

Howard  NO BID NO BID $11.50 / ton $12.20 / ton NO BID NO BID 

Mt. Washington NO BID NO BID $14.75 / ton $13.70 / ton NO BID NO BID 

Prattsburgh  NO BID NO BID $14.50 / ton $13.25 / ton NO BID NO BID 

Woodhull NO BID NO BID $13.25 / ton $15.95 / ton NO BID NO BID 

Corning Comm. College NO BID NO BID $16.75 / ton $15.10 / ton NO BID NO BID 

Plant Site Name: Coopers Plains 
Howard Sand & 

Gravel 
Alfred Station Cohocton Coots Gravel 

Wilkins Sand & 

Gravel 

Plant Site Location: 
Curtis Coopers Rd. 

Painted Post, NY 

Mill Road 

Avoca, NY 
638 NY-244 

Alfred, NY 
Jones Road 

Cohocton NY 

State Route 415 

Campbell, NY 

Moore Rd. 

Bath, NY 

 

 

 
AWARDED BY THE PWC ON 6/6/2021 AS SHADED 
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ICE CONTROL SAND; DELIVERED TO TOWN SHOPS  
BID DATE: 5/20/2021 

CONTRACT: 6/1/2021 – 4/30/2022 

 

 
 

 DALRYMPLE DOLOMITE 
NEW 

ENTERPRISE 

SPALLINA 

MATERIALS 
ST COOTS WILKINS 

LOCATION       

Addison NO BID NO BID $14.75 / ton $15.50 / ton NO BID $12.75 / ton 

Avoca NO BID NO BID $13.50 / ton $12.20 / ton NO BID $9.95 / ton 

Bath NO BID NO BID $14.50 / ton $11.65 / ton NO BID $8.75 / ton 

Bradford NO BID NO BID $15.50 / ton $14.10 / ton NO BID $11.90 / ton 

Cameron NO BID NO BID $13.25 / ton $14.25 / ton NO BID $10.90 / ton 

Campbell NO BID NO BID $14.00 / ton $12.30 / ton NO BID $10.35 / ton 

Canisteo NO BID NO BID $12.00 / ton $13.20 / ton NO BID $11.30 / ton 

Caton NO BID NO BID $16.75 / ton $16.20 / ton NO BID $12.60 / ton 

Cohocton NO BID NO BID $15.00 / ton $10.90 / ton NO BID $9.55 / ton 

Corning NO BID NO BID $16.00 / ton $14.15 / ton NO BID $11.38 / ton 

Dansville NO BID NO BID $12.50 / ton $12.90 / ton NO BID $11.33 / ton 

Erwin NO BID NO BID $16.50 / ton $14.30 / ton NO BID $10.90 / ton 

Fremont NO BID NO BID $12.25 / ton $13.20 / ton NO BID $11.35 / ton 

Greenwood NO BID NO BID $13.00 / ton $14.65 / ton NO BID $12.15 / ton 

Hartsville  NO BID NO BID $13.50 / ton $14.20 / ton NO BID $12.12 / ton 

Hornby NO BID NO BID $17.50 / ton $16.20 / ton NO BID $12.65 / ton 

 

 

 

AWARDED BY THE PWC ON 6/6/2021 AS SHADED 
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ICE CONTROL SAND; DELIVERED TO TOWN SHOPS (CON’T) 
BID DATE: 5/20/2021 

CONTRACT: 6/1/2021 – 4/30/2022 
 

 DALRYMPLE DOLOMITE 
NEW 

ENTERPRISE 

SPALLINA 

MATERIALS 
ST COOTS WILKINS 

LOCATION       

Hornellsville NO BID NO BID $12.00 / ton $13.20 / ton NO BID $11.40 / ton 

Howard NO BID NO BID $11.75 / ton $12.20 / ton NO BID $9.50 / ton 

Jasper NO BID NO BID $13.50 / ton $14.60 / ton NO BID $12.15 / ton 

Lindley  NO BID NO BID $17.00 / ton $14.90 / ton NO BID $11.99 / ton 

Pulteney NO BID NO BID $18.75 / ton $15.40 / ton NO BID $10.65 / ton 

Prattsburgh NO BID NO BID $16.00 / ton $14.00 / ton NO BID $10.40 / ton 

Rathbone NO BID NO BID $15.50 / ton $15.00 / ton NO BID $11.10 / ton 

Thurston NO BID NO BID $16.50 / ton $14.10 / ton NO BID $10.90 / ton 

Troupsburg  NO BID NO BID $14.00 / ton $14.75 / ton NO BID $12.95 / ton 

Tuscarora NO BID NO BID $15.00 / ton $15.10 / ton NO BID $12.60 / ton 

Urbana NO BID NO BID $15.50 / ton $15.45 / ton NO BID $13.13 / ton 

Wayland NO BID NO BID $15.00 / ton $12.75 / ton NO BID $11.13 / ton 

Wayne NO BID NO BID $15.75 / ton $14.45 / ton NO BID $10.99 / ton 

West Union NO BID NO BID $13.50 / ton $16.10 / ton NO BID $13.35 / ton 

Wheeler  NO BID NO BID $14.50 / ton $12.10 / ton NO BID $9.99 / ton 

Woodhull NO BID NO BID $14.00 / ton $14.90 / ton NO BID $12.25 / ton 

Plant Site Name: Coopers Plains 
Howard Sand & 

Gravel 
Alfred Station Cohocton Coots Gravel 

Wilkins Sand & 

Gravel 

Plant Site 

Location: 
Curtis Cooper Rd. 

Painted Post, NY 

Mill Road 

Avoca, NY 
638 NY-244 

Alfred, NY 
Jones Road 

Cohocton NY 

State Route 415 

Campbell, NY 

Moore Rd. 

Bath, NY 

 

AWARDED BY THE PWC ON 6/6/2021 AS SHADED 
 


