
PW-21-023-B                              
TIRES & RECAPPING OF TIRES 

BID DATE: 9/2/21 
ONE TIME PURCHASE 

All Season Tire, 7443 St Rt. 415 North, Bath, NY 14810 (607) 776-9621 / (607) 776-2461 
Parmenter Inc., 103 Railroad Street, Odessa, NY 14869-0427 (607) 594-7106 / (607) 594-7100 
Sedam Tire, 3165 Rt. 246, Perry, NY 14530 (585) 237-2124 / (585) 237-6932 
Tallmadge Tire Service of Cortland NY, 50 Groton Avenue, Cortland, NY 13045 (607) 756-7559 / (607)753-3223 

 
         * As calculated by Steuben County              
      ** Does not meet specs.     
    *** Coin toss 

APPROVED BY THE PWC ON 10/4/2021 AS SHADED 

 ALL SEASON PARMENTER SEDAM TALLMADGE 

TIRE SIZE QTY 
IN TOTO 

PRICE BID 
PER TIRE 

EXTENDED 
LINE ITEM  
PRICE BID 

MEETS 
SPEC: 

YES/NO 

IN TOTO 
PRICE BID 
PER TIRE 

EXTENDED 
LINE ITEM  
PRICE BID 

MEETS 
SPEC: 

YES/NO 

IN TOTO 
PRICE BID 
PER TIRE 

EXTENDED 
LINE ITEM 
PRICE BID 

MEETS 
SPEC. 

YES/NO 

IN TOTO 
PRICE BID 
PER TIRE 

EXTENDED 
LINE ITEM 
PRICE BID 

MEETS SPEC. 
YES/NO 

11R-24.5 100 $ 505.00 $ 50,500.00 YES $ 398.00 $ 39,800.00 YES $ 501.27 $ 50,127.00 YES $ 322.00 $ 32,200.00 YES 

4.25-65-R22.5 20 $ 680.00 $ 13,600.00 YES $ 784.00 $ 15,680.00 YES $ 688.00 $ 13,760.00 YES $ 607.00 $ 12,140.00 YES 

275-70-R22.5 8 $ 310.00 $ 2,480.00 YES $ 360.00 $2,880.00 YES $ 413.94 $ 3,311.52 YES $ 417.00 $ 3,336.00 YES 

245-75-R22.5 8 $ 369.00 $ 2,952.00 YES NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 347.78 $ 2,782.24 YES NO BID NO BID NO BID 

10.00-20 8 $ 325.00 $ 2,600.00 * YES $ 336.55 $ 2,692.40 YES $ 436.00 $ 3,488.00 YES NO BID NO BID NO BID 

245-70—R17 20 $ 125.00 $ 2,500.00 YES $ 154.02 $ 3.080.40 YES $ 117.71 $ 2,354.20 YES NO BID NO BID NO BID 

245-75-R22.5 4 $ 359.00 $ 1,436.00 YES $ 315.00 $ 1.260.00 YES NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

10.00R-22.5 2 $ 305.00 $ 610.00 YES $ 314.40 $ 628.80 YES $ 317.00 $ 634.00 YES NO BID NO BID NO BID 

10.00R-22.5 4 $ 400.00 $ 1,600.00 YES $ 436.63 $ 1,746.52 YES NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

265-70-R17 12 $ 130.00 $ 1,560.00 YES $ 162.26 $ 1,947.12 YES $ 170.36 $ 2,044.32 YES NO BID NO BID NO BID 

1400R-24 6 $ 699.00 $ 4,194.00 YES $ 845.00  $ 5,070.00 YES $ 600.00 $ 3,600.00 YES NO BID NO BID NO BID 

23.5R-25 4 $2,000.00 $ 8,000.00 YES $ 1,590.48 $ 6,361.92 YES $ 1,900.00 $ 7,600.00 YES NO BID NO BID NO BID 

1800-25 1 $ 3,200.00 $ 3,200.00 YES $ 1,579.00 $ 1,579.00 YES NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

10.00R-20 8 $ 350.00 $ 2,800.00 YES $ 475.00 $ 3,800.00 YES NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

255-65-R18 50 $ 135.00 6,750.00 YES $ 147.00 $ 7,350.00 YES $ 148.72 $ 7,436.00 YES NO BID NO BID NO BID 

245-55-R18 50 $ 145.00 $ 7,250.00 YES $ 142.00 $ 7,100.00 NO** $ 148.72 $ 7,436.00 YES NO BID NO BID NO BID 

275-70-R18 16 $ 150.00*** $ 2,400.00 YES $ 174.18 $ 2,786.88 YES $ 150.00*** $ 2,400.00 YES NO BID NO BID NO BID 

11.00R-22.5 8 $ 275.00 $ 2,200.00 YES $ 369.36 $ 2.954.88 YES $ 278.00 $ 2,224.00 YES $ 405.00 $ 3,240.00 YES 
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APPROVED BY THE PWC ON 10/4/2021 AS SHADED 
 

 

 ALL SEASON PARMENTER SEDAM TIRE TALLMADGE  

TIRE SIZE UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT 

11R-24.5 PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE PER TIRE 

P-124 SIERRA 
TREAD 22/32 

FLAT CAP 
$ 137.76 $ 149.00 $ 152.52 $ 127.00 

Nail Holes No Charge No Charge No Charge No Charge 

Spot Repairs No Charge No Charge $ 10.00 No Charge 
TOTAL 

SECTION REPAIRS 
(Per tire) 

No Charge No Charge $ 15.00 $ 5.00 



 
  


