
          

PPPUUURRRCCCHHHAAASSSIIINNNGGG   DDDEEEPPPAAARRRTTTMMMEEENNNTTT   
COUNTY OF STEUBEN 

 
3 EAST PULTENEY SQUARE 

BATH, NEW YORK 14810-1510 
(607) 664-2484 

DATE:   Tuesday, March 13, 2018  
 
MEMO TO: Central Poly Corp. 
  Economy Products 
  Sanico Inc. 
  Tinkertown Incorporated 
  Vasco Brands, Inc.  
 
FROM: Andrew G. Morse, Director of Purchasing 
 
RE: Purchase of Custodial Paper Products, Document # GC-18-007-B

  
 
At the recent meeting of the Administration Committee of the Steuben 
County Legislature, the above referenced bid was awarded on a multiple 
line item basis to Economy Products, Central Poly Corp., and Sanico. 
 
Bid tabulation sheets are available on our website at www.steubencony.org. 
 
If you have any questions regarding this matter, please contact this office. 
 
Thank you for your interest in doing business with Steuben County. 
 
 
 
AGM:jap 
c: file 
 



TITLE:  Custodial Paper Products, 
#GC-18-007-B  

BID DATE: 
March 6, 2018 

DEPARTMENT: 
Purchasing 

CONTACT: 
Bruce Cornell 

 

*Does not meet Spec  **Won coin toss 
 
 

RECYCLED  
PAPER PRODUCTS 
 

VENDOR 
 CENTRAL 

POLY 

VENDOR 
ECONOMY 

VENDOR 
SANICO 

VENDOR 
TINKER-

TOWN 

VENDOR 
VASCO 

 

VENDOR 
 

9" JUMBO TOILET 
PAPER ROLLS,  
2-PLY, 
2ROLLS/CARTON 

MFG 
BRAND 

ATLAS ATLAS KRUGER ATLAS   

ORDER 
NUMBER 

APM800 APM800 1592PLY APM800GREE
N 

  

CASE COST 
 

21.88 16.31 18.96 18.98 NO BID  
ROLL COST 
 

1.92 1.359 1.58 1.58   
 
#2 ROLL TISSUE, 
WHITE,  2 ply 

MFG 
BRAND 

ATLAS ATLAS ATLAS* ATLAS VONDREHLE  
ORDER 
NUMBER 

A280 #280 15275 APM280GREE
N 

VON6022  

CASE COST 
 

31.77 31.99 29.76 46.96 48.00  
ROLL COST 
 

.397 .399 .31 .587 .50  
SHEET COST 
 

.00079 .00079 .00062 .0011 .001  
  
#3 BOXED FACIAL 
TISSUE, WHITE, 
 2 PLY 

MFG 
BRAND 

CENTRAL 
POLY 

SILKY SOFT ATLAS EMPRESS   

ORDER 
NUMBER 

BP10030 SILKY 15FACIAL ELFT301013   

CASE COST 
 

11.99 12.15 14.10 16.40 NO BID  

SHEET COST 
 

.0040 .00405 .0047 .0054   

  
#4 TOWELS, 
SINGLE FOLD, 
NATURAL 

MFG 
BRAND 

MARCAL** NPM SCA TISSUE PENNY LANE   

ORDER 
NUMBER 

P600N SF4000K 135K1850A PNL8210   
CASE COST 13.20 13.20 NO BID 21.35 NO BID  
       
SHEET COST 
 

.0033 .0033  .0053   



 
RECYCLED  
PAPER PRODUCTS 
 
 

VENDOR 
CENTRAL 

POLY 

VENDOR 
ECONOMY 

 

VENDOR 
SANICO 

VENDOR 
TINKER-

TOWN 

VENDOR 
VASCO 

VENDOR 
 

#5 TOWELS, ROLL, 
NATURAL 
TORK #13290088 
OR APPROVED 
EQUAL 

MFG 
BRAND 

 SCA SCA TISSUE    

ORDER 
NUMBER 

 290088 13290088 NO BID NO BID  
CASE COST NO BID 45.00 38.61    
       
ROLL COST 
 

 7.50 6.43    
  
#6 TOWELS, 
MULTIFOLD, 
NATURAL 

MFG 
BRAND 

MARCAL NPM** NITTANY NOVA PROLINK  

ORDER 
NUMBER 

P200N 4000NMF 21NMPFN4000 NOVA MK250 PLBC1006D  
CASE COST 12.25 12.25 12.96 14.99 15.20  
       
SHEET COST 
 

.00306 .00306 .00324 .0037 .0038  
        
 #7 TOWELS, 
ROLL, 
PERFORATED 

MFG 
BRAND 

MARCAL NPM NITTANY GEN   

ORDER 
NUMBER 

6350  21NP3085 GEN1797 NO BID  
CASE COST 15.45 14.70 15.90 18.50   
       
SHEET COST 
 

.0061 .0057 .00623 .0072   
 
#8 TOWEL, 
NATURAL, ROLL 
DISPENSER TYPE, 
BAYWEST #200, 
DISPENSER 
#543/670 

MFG 
BRAND 

MARCAL NPM     
ORDER 
NUMBER 

P720N 12350 NO BID NO BID NO BID  
CASE COST 13.99 13.50     
       
ROLL  COST 1.1658 1.12     



 
 
 
 
 
 
 
RECYCLED PAPER 
PRODUCTS 
 

VENDOR 
CENTRAL 

POLY 

VENDOR 
ECONOMY 

VENDOR 
SANICO 

VENDOR 
TINKER-

TOWN 

VENDOR 
VASCO 

VENDOR 

#9 GARDS, MAXI 
PAD, #147, 
DISPENSER TYPE 

MFG 
BRAND 

 HOSPECO HUFF    
ORDER 
NUMBER 

NO BID MT-4 18147 NO BID NO BID  
CASE COST 
 

 28.90 33.30    
UNIT COST 
 

 .11 .1332    

 
#10 GARDS, MAXI 
PAD, #248, 
INDIVIDUALLY 
BOXED, BULK 

MFG 
BRAND 

 HOSPECO HUFF    
ORDER 
NUMBER 

NO BID MT-8 18248 NO BID NO BID  
CASE COST  34.50 40.00    
       
UNIT COST 
 

 .138 .16    

  
 
 



 
 
REGULAR  
PAPER PRODUCTS 
 
 

VENDOR 
CENTRAL 

POLY 

VENDOR 
ECONOMY 

 

VENDOR 
SANICO 

VENDOR 
TINKER-

TOWN 

VENDOR 
VASCO 

VENDOR 
 

#1 enMOTION 
ROLL TOWEL, 
WHITE 

MFG 
BRAND 

VONDREHLE NPM** NITTANY    
ORDER 
NUMBER 

816B 680010EP 21NP610800 NO BID NO BID  
CASE COST 
 

36.00 36.00 38.40    
ROLL SIZE 
 

800’ 800’ 800’    
ROLL COST 
 

6.00 6.00 6.40    
 

#2 TOWEL, white 
roll, dispenser type, 
8” x 1000’ 

MFG 
BRAND 

 NPM     
ORDER 
NUMBER 

NO BID 6950EP NO BID NO BID NO BID  
CASE COST 
 

 35.90     
ROLL SIZE 
 

 1000’     
ROLL  COST 
 

 5.98     
 

#4 ALL PURPOSE 
WIPES 

MFG 
BRAND 

 BROTEX MERCANTILE    
ORDER 
NUMBER 

NO BID BW5104995 1987007 NO BID NO BID  
CASE COST 
 

 38.70 31.68    
UNIT COST 
 

 .043 .0396    
 

#5 BAYWEST 
ROLL TOWEL  

MFG 
BRAND 

VONDREHLE BW/NPM     
ORDER 
NUMBER 

880NS 313/6800NY NO BID NO BID NO BID  
CASE COST 28.77 26.25     
       
SHEET COST 
 

4.795 4.37     
 

 
**Won coin toss 
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