
  
 
 

 

 
DATE:  December 19, 2018 
 
MEMO TO: Bob Barker 

Gall’s 
Ranger Outfitters 

  United Uniform 
        
FROM:  Andrew G. Morse, Director of Purchasing 
 
RE:  Sheriff and Correction Officer Uniforms GC-18-032-B 
 
At the recent meeting of the Public Safety & Corrections Committee of the Steuben 
County Legislature, the above referenced bid was awarded on a line item basis to Bob 
Barker, Gall’s, Ranger Outfitters, and United Uniform. 
 
The tab sheet available on the Steuben County website www.steubencony.org. 
 
If you have any questions regarding this matter, please contact this office. 
 
Thank you for your interest in doing business with Steuben County. 
 
 
AGM:jap 
 

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
COUNTY OF STEUBEN 

 
3 East Pulteney Square 
Bath, New York 14810 

607-664-2484 
 



TITLE:  Sheriff & Correction Officer 
Uniforms, Document #GC-18-032-B  

DATE: 
November 19, 2018 

DEPARTMENT:  
Steuben County Sheriff’s Department and Jail    

CONTACT:  Terri Moir, Sheriff’s 
Department; Diane Volz, Jail 

 
BIDDER 
 

Bob Barker Gall’s Ranger 
Outfitters 

United 
Uniform 

ITEM –  
Uniforms /Brass 

    

tie NO BID $3.75 $6.50 $9.50 

Trouser men’s NO BID $77.70 $49.99 $76.50 

Trouser women’s NO BID $77.70 $49.99 $76.50 

shirt – short sleeve 
men’s 

NO BID $58.00 $60.79 $55.50 

Shirt – short sleeve 
women’s 

NO BID $58.00 $60.79 $55.50 

shirt – long sleeve 
men’s 

NO BID $60.00 $63.79 $57.50 

Shirt – long sleeve 
women’s 

NO BID $60.00 $63.79 $57.50 

sweater NO BID $34.00 $64.50 $39.50 

winter coat NO BID $185.00 $136.87* $209.50 

softshell jacket NO BID $89.25 $89.99 $95.50 

hat – Stetson F38 $69.12 $80.00 $87.50 $84.50 

hat – knit NO BID $22.00 $12.99 $15.50 

traffic safety vest NO BID $63.89 $35.99 $49.50 

polo shirt/T shirt NO BID $20.00 $26.50/$13.00 $19.50 

boots – basic NO BID $115.00 NO BID $119.50 

boots – ultra light NO BID $76.92 NO BID $73.50 

Boots men’s 
Weinbrenner shoe 
Co. 

NO BID $109.66 $111.00  $105.00 

Boots men’s Rocky 
Alphaforce  

NO BID $81.36 
 

NO BID $89.50 

Boots men’s 
Corcoran Marauder 

NO BID $151.53 NO BID  $138.50 

  



BIDDER Bob Barker Gall’s Ranger 
Outfitters 

United 
Uniform 

Boots men’s Danner 
Tachyon 

NO BID $114.00 $106.00 $118.50 

Boots women’s 
Danner Acadia 

NO BID $304.00 NO BID $248.50 

Boots men’s 5.11 
Tactical; Style 12318 

NO BID $108.35 $121.00 $98.50 

Boots women’s 5.11 
Tactical; Style 12217 

NO BID $108.35 NO BID $104.50 

raincoat NO BID $125.00 $115.00 $94.50 

Badge; pin-on NO BID $85.00 $89.00 $74.50 

Badge; wallet NO BID $85.00 NO BID $74.50 

badge NOT hi-glo NO BID $65.00 
 

$79.99 $65.50 

collar brass NO BID $16.00 $25.99 $13.50 

name tag NO BID $12.50 $10.50 $12.50 

handcuff $21.96 $22.05 $29.00 $25.50 

tie bar NO BID $16.00 $9.50 
 

$15.50 

% of discount 
from published 
manufacturer’s 
list prices for 
additional items 
not listed 

10% 10% NO BID 20% 

 
 
*Coat does not include liner. 
 
BIDDERS 

• Bob Barker Co., 7925 Purfoy Rd., Fuquay Varina NC 27526 
• Galls, LLC, 1340 Russell Cave Road, Lexington KY 40505 
• Ranger Outfitters, 261 Baker St., Corning NY 14830 
• United Uniform Dist. LLC, 495 North French Road, Buffalo, NY 14228 
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