PURCHASING DEPARTIMENT

COUNTY OF STEUBEN

3 EAST PULTENEY SQUARE
BATH, NEW YORK 14810-1510
(607) 664-2484

Date: November 20, 2018

MEMO TO: Blevins
Vine City Supply

FROM: Andrew G. Morse, Director of Purchasing

RE: Residential Heating Systems Bid Award

At the recent meeting of the Human Services, Health & Ed committee of the
Steuben County Legislature the above referenced bid was awarded to Blevins
and Vine City Supply on a line item basis, low bidder.

Summary of bids will be available on the Steuben County website.

If you have any questions, please contact this office.

Thank you for your interest in doing business with Steuben County.
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RESIDENTIAL HEATING SYSTEMS DOCUMENT #GC-18-031-B
VENDOR | VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
Blevins Vine City

CATEGORY Supply

1. Condensing Gas Fired Forced Air Furnace; Natural/LP Gas

UPFLOW 90+

60,000 BTU No Bid $745.56

80,000 BTU No Bid $771.24

100,000 BTU No Bid $1160.94

120,000 BTU No Bid $1301.36

HORIZONTAL 90+

60,000 BTU No Bid $745.56

80,000 BTU No Bid $771.24

100,000 BTU No Bid $1160.94

120,000 BTU No Bid $1301.36

DOWNFLOW 90+

60,000 BTU No Bid No Bid

80,000 BTU No Bid No Bid

100,000 BTU No Bid No Bid

120,000 BTU No Bid No Bid

90+ LP conversion kit | No Bid $50.00

2. Natural Gas Fir

ed Forced Air Furnace

UPFLOW 80+

60,000 BTU No Bid $594.70
80,000 BTU No Bid $525.76
100,000 BTU No Bid $691.44
120,000 BTU No Bid $698.32
HORIZONTAL 80+

60,000 BTU No Bid $594.70
80,000 BTU No Bid $525.76
100,000 BTU No Bid $691.44
120,000 BTU No Bid $698.32
DOWNFLOW 80+

60,000 BTU No Bid No Bid
80,000 BTU No Bid No Bid
100,000 BTU No Bid No Bid
120,000 BTU No Bid No Bid
80+ LP conversion kit | No Bid | $50.00




RESIDENTIAL HEATING SYSTEMS

DOCUMENT #GC-18-031-B

VENDOR | VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR

Blevins Vine City
CATEGORY Supply

3. QOil Fired Forced Air Furnace

LOWBOY
60,000-99,000 BTU No Bid $1431.40
100,000-140,000 BTU No Bid $1540.27
141,000-175,000 BTU No Bid No Bid
HIGHBOY
60,000-99,000 BTU No Bid $1293.97
100,000-140,000 BTU No Bid $1307.35
141,000-175,000 BTU No Bid $1460.84
HORIZONTAL
60,000-99,000 BTU No Bid No Bid
100,000-140,000 BTU No Bid No Bid
141,000-175,000 BTU No Bid No Bid
DOWNFLOW
60,000-99,000 BTU No Bid No Bid
100,000-140,000 BTU No Bid No Bid
141,000-175,000 BTU No Bid No Bid

4. Mobile Home Approved Furnace; CMF or equivalent quality

Gas/LP fired

80,000 BTU No Bid $1200.72
Oil fired

80,000 BTU $932.51 $891.73

5. Mobile Home Appr. Furnace; M-type or

Coleman, A/C compatible

Power Gas/LP burner

77,000 BTU $586.56 No Bid
Power OIl/LP burner
77,000 BTU $957.05 No Bid




RESIDENTIAL HEATING SYSTEMS

DOCUMENT #GC-18-031-B

VENDOR | VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
Blevins Vine City
CATEGORY Supply

6. Mobile Home Approved boiler

Ol fired hot water boiler

With coill No Bid No Bid

80,000-120,000 BTU

Without coill No Bid No Bid

80,000-120,000 BTU

Propane fired hot water

70,000 BTU No Bid No Bid

140,000 BTU No Bid No Bid

210,000 BTU No Bid No Bid

Natural Gas fired hot water boiler

70,000 BTU No Bid No Bid

105,000 BTU No Bid No Bid

140,000 BTU No Bid No Bid

175,000 BTU No Bid No Bid

210,000 BTU No Bid No Bid
7. Space Heater

Natural/LP Gas

35,000 BTU No Bid $155.35

55,000 BTU No Bid $155.35

65,000 BTU No Bid $204.09

8. Mobile Home Approved Furnace 95+

Natural/LP Gas

45,000 BTU $1046.00

No Bid

72,000 BTU $1221.00

No Bid

9. MLR7 Mobile Home Approved Furnace 95+

Natural/LP Gas

45,000 BTU $1037.00 | No Bid
60,000 BTU $1048.00 | No Bid
72,000 BTU $1097.00 | No Bid
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