TITLE: Custodial Paper Products, | BID DATE: DEPARTMENT: CONTACT:

#GC-19-011-B April 3, 2019 Purchasing Bruce Cornell

RECYCLED VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR

PAPER PRODUCTS CENTRAL ECONOMY REGIONAL SANICO UNITED VASCO

POLY
19" JUMBO MFG

f#I'OILET DAPER BRAND ATLAS ATLAS NO BID KRUGER ATLAS ATLAS

ROLLS,

SROLLS/ICARTON | ORDER APMB800 APMB800 1592PLY 800 QPMSOOGREE
CASE COST 16.31 15.99 17.88 15.96 16.80
ROLL COST 1.36* 1.33* 1.49 1.33 1.40*

#2 ROLL TISSUE, MFG

WHITE, 2 ply BRAND ATLAS ATLAS ESSITY TORK | 1 NITTANY VONDREHLE
(N)ER’A%F:ER 280 #280 TM1616S 15MBT1975 NP9650033 VONG6022
CASE COST 33.77 37.20 32.19 28.80 31.00 43.20
ROLL COST 422 46 335 .30 322916 45
SHEET COST .00084 .00093 .00067** .0006** .000645** .0009

3 BOXED FACIAL | MFG

’?”SSUEV WHITE. BRAND CENTRAL SILKY SOFT NO BID ATLAS ELEGANT GEN

2PLY POLY
ORDER -
NUMBER 2930 SILKY 15FACIAL 826-100 GENG6501
CASE COST 11.99 12.98 15.90 11.50 18.00
SHEET COST .0040 .0043 .0053 .00383 .00600

#4 TOWELS, MFG

SINGLE FOLD. BRAND MARCAL NPM KRUGER SCA TISSUE MARCAL VONDREHLE

NATURAL
SE,E\’AEBFER P60ON SFK4000 01802 135K1850A P60ON VON540K
CASE COST 14.20 14.67 13.30 19.70 13.10 23.20
SHEET COST .0035 .0036 .00333 .004924 .00327 .0058

*As calculated by Steuben County

**Does not meet spec.




RECYCLED VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
PAPER PRODUCTS CENTRAL | ECONOMY | REGIONAL | SANICO UNITED VASCO
POLY
5 TOWELS, ROLL, | MFG
75 TOWEL VS NO BID SCA ESSITY TORK | SCATISSUE | NO BID VONDREHLE
TORK #13290088
OR APPROVED ORDER 290088 290088 13290088 VONS8S80ON
EQUAL NUMBER
CASE COST 1374 4339 38.61 18.68
ROLL COST 729 7232 6.435 311+
#6 TOWELS, MFG
ETOWELS — | WFG MARCAL NPM KRUGER NITTANY NITTANY | VONDREHLE
NATURAL
ORDER | P200N 4000MFK 01820 2TNMPFN4000 | MFN4000 VON548K
CASEGOST | 13.05 12.94 1250 13.96 12.25 16.40
SEETCOST | 0033 0032 00313 00349 00306 0041
FTTOWELS, | WEG MARCAL NPM KRUGER KRUGER ATLAS NO BID
PERFORATED ORDER 3
ORDER | 6350 585 01702 15HHT30702 | 585
CASEGOST | 15.35 15.84 14.70 15.96 1475
SFEETCOST | 006 0062 007 0076 0057
8 TOWEL, MFG
FTOWEL, WG NO BID NPM NO BID NO BID NITTANY | VONDREHLE
BAYWEST #200, | | ORDER 12350N NP-12350EN | VONB35N
DISPENSER
#543/670 CASE COST 14.50 13.35 17.36
ROLL COST 120 11125 1447

** Does not meet spec.




RECYCLED PAPER VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
PRODUCTS CENTRAL ECONOMY REGIONAL SANICO UNITED VASCO
POLY

#9 GARDS, MAXI | MFG
PAD, 147 BRAND NO BID HOSPECO NO BID HUFF NO BID NO BID
DISPENSER TYPE  5RBER -

NUMBER MT-4 18MTY

CASE COST 28.90 32.50

UNIT COST 11 13
#10 GARDS, MAXI | MFG NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

PAD, #248,
INDIVIDUALLY
BOXED, BULK

BRAND

ORDER
NUMBER

CASE COST

UNIT COST




REGULAR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR VENDOR
PAPER PRODUCTS CENTRAL ECONOMY REGIONAL SANICO UNITED VASCO
POLY
1enMOTION MFG
Eoeﬂ_ TOWEL. ARAND VONDREHLE | ATLAS NO BID NITTANY MORCON LAKE PAPER
WHITE CN’s"?AEBFER 816B 680010EP 21NP610800 VT106 LP108006
CASE COST 49.99 36.00 39.30 35.25 22.02
ROLL SIZE 10” X 800’ 10X800 800’ 10X550** 10”X800’
ROLL COST 8.332 6.00 6.55 5.875 3.97
#2 TOWEL, white MFG NO BID NPM CRYSTALWA | NO BID NO BID NO BID
roll, dispenser type, BRAND
8 x 1000” RE
ORDER
NV 6950EX HRTW6800
CASE COST 34.44 18.45
ROLL SIZE 8X950 87X800’
ROLL COST 5.74 3.0754
zslgllz-é- PURPOSE ’QARFSND NO BID BROTEX LEGACY CON | MERCANTILE | NOBID STAR WIPERS
gsfgéR BW5104Q95 202-100 1987007 STW3052-GF
CASE COST 41.50 41.79 49.19
UNIT COST .046 .03869 .0488
#4 BAYWEST MFG
OLL TOWEL BRAND NO BID BW/NPM NO BID NO BID NITTANY NO BID
ORDER _ 3136800YN NP-6800YN
CASE COST 26.22 25.30
ROLL COST 4.37 4.25

**Does not meet spec




