ASPHALT MILLING
(Mill surface blacktop with conveyor load out)
BID DATE: 2/24/2022
CONTRACT TERM: 3/7/2022 —12/31/2022

Bothar Construction, LLC, 170 East Service Road, Binghamton, NY 13901 (607) 723-5012 / (607) 723-4982
Donegal Construction Corporation, PO Box 450, New Stanton, PA 15672 (724) 423-7500 / (724) 423-7501
Killian Construction LLC, PO Box 64585, Rochester, NY 14624 (585) 334-1572 / (585) 262-6011

Suit-Kote Corporation, 1911 Lorings Crossing Road, Cortland, NY 13045 (607) 753-1100 / (315) 238-7110

Location *

BOTHAR CONSTRUCTION

Rental Period

1-Day

2 — 4 Days

5 or More /Days

Greater than 6” — 3”
Drum Machine

$ 5,350.00 / day

$ 5,250.00 / day

$ 5,150.00 / day

3’ to 4’ Wide Drum
Machine

Location *

No Bid

No Bid

DONEGAL CONSTRUCTION

No Bid

Rental Period

1-Day

2 - 4 Days

5 or More Days

Greater than 6” — 3”
Drum Machine

$ 4,700.00 / day

$ 4,600.00 / day

$ 4,500.00 / day

3’ to 4’ Wide Drum
Machine

Location *

$ 3,800.00 / day

$ 3,600.00 / day

KILLIAN CONSTRUCTION

$ 3,500.00 / day

Rental Period

1-Day

2 - 4 Days

5 or More Days

Greater than 6” — 3”
Drum Machine

$ 5,675.00 / day

$ 5,475.00 / day

$ 5,275.00 / day

3’ to 4’ Wide Drum
Machine

Location *

$ 4,500.00 / day

$ 4,400.00 / day

SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION

$ 4,300.00 / day

Rental Period

1-Day

2 — 4 Days

5 or More Days

Greater than 6” — 3”
Drum Machine

$ 5,500.00 / day

$ 5,400.00 / day

$5,300.00 / day

3’ to 4’ Wide Drum
Machine

* Within Steuben County

No Bid

MULTIPLE AWARD BASED ON LOWEST PRICE AND AVAILABILITY

No Bid

AWARDED BY THE PWC ON MARCH 7, 2022

No Bid

2/24/2022

PW-22-042-B



