Line Item Number

Product Name

TRAFFIC CONTROL SUPPLIES

BID DATE: 6/2/2022

S&S Signs & Safety Equipment, 1400 Sullivan Street, Elmira, NY 14901 (607) 562-8463 / (607) 562-8183
Safety Zone Specialists, PO Box 90764, Lakeland Florida, 33804 (863) 816-3402 / (863) 816-3437
Bradco Supply Co., 80 Old Mills Road, Towanda, PA 18848, (570) 265-6167 / (570) 265-9488

SIGNS & SAFETY SAFETY ZONE .

Unit of
Measure

In Toto Price
per Unit

Extended
Line Item
Price Bid

In Toto Price
per Unit

Extended
Line Item
Price Bid

In Toto Price
per Unit

6/02/22

Extended
Line Item
Price Bid

Breakaway Barricade

each

$204.43

$10,221.50

$230.50

$11,525.00

NO BID

NO BID

Barricade Flashing Amber Light

each

$23.10

$1,155.00

$17.85

$892.50

NO BID

NO BID

Fluorescent Vest; Light Weight

each

-0-

-0-

-0-

-0-

-0-

-0-

Fluorescent Vest; Heavy Duty

each

$8.52

$639.00

$14.50

$1,087.50

$15.00

$1,125.00

Hard Hat

each

$12.22

$391.04

$12.00

$384.00

$12.00

$ 384.00

Roll-Up Sign; Non- Reflective

each

-0-

-0-

-0-

-0-

-0 -

-0-

Roll-Up Sign; Reflective

each

$52.50

$1,575.00

$ 88.50

$2,655.00

NO BID

NO BID

Roll-Up Sign Stand

each

$83.71

$1,674.20

$125.15

$2,503.00

NO BID

NO BID
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Safety Fence

50’ roll

-0-

-0-

-0-

-0-

-0 -

-0-

—
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Traffic Barrel

each

-0-

-0-

-0-

-0-

-0 -

-0-

[
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Ballasting Collar

each

$3.50

$105.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
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Traffic Con- 28” Slim Line

each

-0-

-0-

-0-

-0-

-0-
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Traffic Cone p/n 36 po64-tc2

each

$21.57

$4,314.00

$22.50

$ 4,500.00

NO BID
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Warning Flag

each

$4.24

$42.40

NO BID

NO BID

$52.50
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Warning Flag-solid (non-mesh)

each

$3.97

$238.20

NO BID

NO BID

$375.00
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6 Volt Battery

each

$3.94

$236.40

NO BID

NO BID

$261.00
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Stop/Slow Paddle

each

$48.78

$487.80

$44.75

$ 447.50

$627.50
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Reflective Collars; 4” width

pieces

-0-

-0-

-0-

-0-

-0-

—
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Reflective Collars; 6” width

pieces

-0-

-0-

-0-

-0-

-0-

S}
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Mechanics Work Gloves

pair

$154.80

NO BID

$240.00

[\
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Artic Thermal Gloves

pair

$296.00

Quantity per size shall be: 10 Med., 15 Large, 15 X-Large. 15 2X-Large, 10 3X-Large, and 10 4X-Large; total quantity shall equal 75 vests.
®) Quantity per size shall be: 100 pair of XL gloves; total quantity shall equal 100 pair of gloves.

* Non responsive bidder. Did not submit required Iranian Energy Sector Divestment

MULTIPLE AWARD

AWARDED BY THE PWC ON JUNE 6, 2022

$ 745.00

$1,175.00

PW-22-049-B



