STONE FILL TRUCKING SERVICES

Bid Date: 4/7/2022

Dgien Trucking, Inc., 7455 County Route 27, Hornell, NY 14843 (607) 769-5040 / (607) 566-2565
Dolomite Products Company, Inc., / dba A.L. Blades, 7610 County Route 65, Hornell, NY 14843 (607) 324-3636 / (607) 324-0998
Leon Lacy, Inc., 1266 Airport Road, Hornell, NY 14843 (607) 324-0840 / (607) 324-9400

Contract Period: Date of Award — 12/31/22

4/7/22

TRUCKING SERVICES-TRI-AXLE DUMP (FROM PLANT TO NOTED QUADRANT)

Product Location Dgien Trucking Dolomite Products Leon Lacy
Quadrant1l | Quadrant2 | Quadrant3 | Quadrant4 Quadrantl | Quadrant2 | Quadrant3 | Quadrant4 || Quadrantl | Quadrant2 | Quadrant3 | Quadrant4
Dolomite Products Company, Inc.
S-tBO?]t: i:l|\|||6\iv Ij;:t( (620.03) $16.50 /ton | $15.50 /ton | $14.75/ton | $ 13.50 /ton || $ 33.50 /ton | $ 33.50 /ton | $33.50 /ton | $33.50/ton || $ 13.75/ton | $13.75/ton | $ 13.75/ton | $ 13.75/ton
Clean Oversize Rock Fill
Trucks Available 3 3 10
Multiple Award Base on Lowest Price and Availability
Quadrant 1 Quadrant 2 Quadrant 3 Quadrant 4
Addison Cameron Avoca Bath
Campbell Canisteo Cohocton Bradford
Caton Greenwood Dansville Prattsburgh
Corning Hartsville Fremont Pulteney
Erwin Jasper Hornellsville Urbana
Hornby Troupsburg Howard Wayne
Lindley West Union Wayland Wheeler
Rathbone Woodhull
Thurston
Tuscarora

Awarded by the PWC on 5/2/22

PW-22-107-B (Page 1)




Bid Date: 4/7/2022

Contract Period: Date of Award — 12/31/22

STONE FILL TRUCKING SERVICES

4/7/22

TRUCKING SERVICES-TRAILER DUMP (FROM PLANT TO NOTED QUADRANT)

Product Location Dgien Trucking Dolomite Products Leon Lacy
Quadrant1l | Quadrant2 | Quadrant3 | Quadrant4 Quadrant1l | Quadrant2 | Quadrant3 | Quadrant4 || Quadrantl | Quadrant2 | Quadrant3 | Quadrant4
Dolomite Products Company, Inc.
S-tBoeI}]t(Ehi:ll\llleivljgl':]l: (620.03) $16.50/ton | $15.50/ton | $14.75/ton | $13.50/ton|| NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID || $13.00/ton | $13.00/ton | $13.00/ton | $13.00/ton
Clean Oversize Rock Fill
Trucks Available 2 NO BID 5
Multiple Award Base on Lowest Price and Availability
Quadrant 1 Quadrant 2 Quadrant 3 Quadrant 4
Addison Cameron Avoca Bath
Campbell Canisteo Cohocton Bradford
Caton Greenwood Dansville Prattsburgh
Corning Hartsville Fremont Pulteney
Erwin Jasper Hornellsville Urbana
Hornby Troupsburg Howard Wayne
Lindley West Union Wayland Wheeler
Rathbone Woodhull
Thurston
Tuscarora
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