
  
 
 

 

 
 
DATE:  May 17, 2022 
 
MEMO TO: ARC GLOW 
  Birnie Bus Service 

Transpo Bus Services LLC 
      
FROM:  Andrew G. Morse, Director of Purchasing 
 
RE:  Transportation Services for Pre-School Children with Special Needs 
                   GC-22-010-B 
 
At the recent meeting of the Human Services, Health and Education Committee of the 
Steuben County Legislature, the above referenced bid was awarded to ARC GLOW, 
Birnie Bus Service, and Transpo Bus Services LLC.  A bid tabulation sheet is available on 
the Steuben County website www.steubencony.org 
 
If you have any questions regarding this matter, please contact this office. 
 
Thank you for your interest in doing business with Steuben County. 
 
 
 
AGM:jap 
C:file 
 

PPPUUURRRCCCHHHAAASSSIIINNNGGG   DDDEEEPPPAAARRRTTTMMMEEENNNTTT   
COUNTY OF STEUBEN 

 
3 EAST PULTENEY SQUARE 

BATH, NEW YORK 14810-1510 
(607) 664-2484 

   

http://www.steubencony.org/


Transportation of SC Children w/Special Needs  GC-22-010-B 
 

VENDOR: ARC 
GLOW 

Birnie Bus 
Service 

Transpo 
Bus Svces 

Alt #1 

Transpo 
Bus  Svces 

Alt #2 
Contract A: 
Kidstart ------------ ------------ ------------ ----------- 
Cost per child per day 
for 10 month program: $180.00 No Bid $515.00 $495/$20 
Cost per child per day 
for summer program: $180.00 No Bid $515.00 $495/$70 
Contract B: 
Corning- Painted Post ------------ ------------ ------------ ----------- 
Cost per child per day 
for 10 month program: No Bid $105.99 $91.00 $495/$67 
Cost per child per day 
for summer program: N/A N/A N/A N/A 
Contract C: 
Yates ARC/Keuka Lake 
School 

--------------- --------------- ------------- ------------ 

Cost per child per day 
for 10 month program: No Bid No Bid $198.00 $420/$95 
Cost per child per day 
for summer program: No Bid No Bid $230.00 $420/$95 
Contract D: 
Hornell City  4410 

--------------- ---------------- ----------------- -------------- 
Cost per child per day 
for 10 month program: No Bid $159.99 $204.00 $440/$70 
Cost per child per day 
for summer program: No Bid $159.99 $515.00 

 
$495/$50 



 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

ARC GLOW 
18 Main St. 
Mount Morris NY 14510 
 
Birnie Bus Service 
1300 Floyd Avenue 
Rome NY 13440 
 
Transpo Bus Services 
150 Josons Drive 
Rochester NY 14623 

VENDOR: ARC 
GLOW 

Birnie Bus 
Service 

Transpo 
Bus Svces 

Alt #1 

Transpo 
Bus Svces 

Alt #2 
Contract E: 
GST BOCES 4410 

-------------- ---------------- ---------------- ------------- 
Cost per child per day 
for 10 month program: No Bid $159.99 $204.00 $440/$70 
Cost per child per day 
for summer program: N/A N/A N/A N/A 
Contract F: 
GST BOCES 4410 (Bath 
School) 

---------------- ----------------- ----------------- -------------- 

Cost per child per day 
for 10 month program: N/A N/A N/A N/A 
Cost per child per day  
for summer program: No Bid $159.99 $515.00 $495/$20 
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